2011 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT FILED

Apr 28, 2011
DOCUMENT# P99000062627 Secretary of State

Entity Name: ATLANTIC COAST LIMOUSINE INC.

Current Principal Place of Business: New Principal Place of Business:
232 BASIN DR

LAUDERDALE BY THE SEA, FL 33308 US

Current Mailing Address: New Mailing Address:

1701 NE 28 TERRACE
POMPANO BEACH, FL 33062 US

FEI Number: 65-0924835 FEI Number Applied For { ) FEI Number Not Applicable ( ) Certificate of Status Desired ( )

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent: Name and Address of New Registered Agent:

DUBROW DUKER & ASSOCIATES PA
5401 NORTH UNIVERSITY DRIVE STE 204
CORAL SPRINGS, FL 33067 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both,
in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE:

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent Date

OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS:

Title: P
Name: CHARBONNEAU, ANDRE
Address: 1701 NE 28 TERRACE

City-St-Zip:  POMPANO BEACH, FL 33062 US

| hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic

signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that | am an officer or director of the corporation or the receiver
or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears above, or

on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: ANDRE CHARBONNEAU P 04/28/2011
Electronic Signature of Signing Officer or Director Date




Atlantic Coast Limousine
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From: “Atlantic Coast f.imousihe" <info@aclimo.com> _
To: "Yarbrough, Lee" <l_ee.Yarbrough@DOS.MyFlorida.com>
Sent: Meonday, August 01, 2011 21:10

Subject: Re: 2011 Annual Report (P85000062627)
Mr. Lee Yarbrough,

This is to confirm receipt of your email as well as to let you know that [ will mail a check (08/02/2011) for
the sum of $150.00 for the renewal of the Annual Report made to the arder of Florida Department of
State. As meniioned, the $400.00 fee is waived due to the fact that | made 2 payments oniine on April
28th but the payment was not accepted by the merchant because it would not recognize the cvv code.

Thank you for your attenticn fo this matter and do not hesitate to contact me if you need any further
information.

Atlantic Coast Limousine, Inc.

Andre Charbonneau

info(@aclimo.com i _

954-545-LIMO (5466) _ -

-—— Original Message ~—
From: Yarbrough, Lee —
To: info@aclimo.com

Sent: Monday, July 25, 2011 16:26

Subject: 2011 Annual Report (P99000062627)

Good Afterncon Mr. Charbonneau,

After speaking with you and your card provider representative this afterncon | spoke fo the
Administrator over the Annual Report filings concerning your situation. in researching we can see an
attempt to file the 2011 Annual Report for ATLANTIC COAST LIMOUSINE INC. was made on
04/28/2011. Since this attempt is logged on our database we can waive the $400.00 late fee and allow
the filing to be made and accept the regular filing fee of $150.00. Unfortunately the payment will have fo
be made via check and as discussed earlier we can accept the check from your bank made payable to
the Fiorida Department of State.

Please reply back to confirm receipt of this email and if you have any further questions please contact
me at the number below or via reply to this email.

Please mail to;

Division of Corporations
Attn: Lee Yarbrough
PO Box 6327
Tallahassee, FL 32314

For overnight/courier maik:
Division of Corporations
Atfin: Lee Yarbrough

2661 Executive Center Circle
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Thanks,

Lee Yarbrough
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