PLEASE HI:AD ALL INSTRUCTIONS BEFORE COMPLETING THIS FORM

. ffﬁ %@0

A oo T 7 i t,ll i;'%
a‘iio\'/

ky

’ MENT 3%

DOCUMENT # P94000021753 FILED
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7. Names and Street Addresses of Each Officer and/or Director (Florida nonprofit corperations must list at least 3 directors)

Zip

Name of Officers Street Address of Each
Title(s) and/or Directors Officer and/or Director City / State / Zip
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8. Name and Address of Current Registered Agent 9. Name and Address of New Registered Agent
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10. |, being appointed the reg‘riler agent of the above named corporation, am familiar with and accep! the obligations of Section 607.0505, F.S,

Signature of > / /
Registered Mgent)< Al . Date _/Q __8 0o
REGISTERED AGENT MUST SIGN

11. This corporation owes the current year (See other side for information
Intangible Personal Property Tax due June 30. Yes 1 No O on intanglble tax.)

12. | certify that | am an officer or director or the receiver or frustee empowered 1o execute this application as provided for in chapter 607 or 617, F.S. | further certify that when filing
this reinstatement appfication, the reason for dissolution has been eliminated, the corporate name satisfies the requirements of section 607.0401 or 617.0401, F.S., that all fees
owed by the corperation have been paid and the names of individuals listed on this form do not qualify for an exemption under section 119.67(3)(i), F.S. The information indicated

on this application is true and accurate, and my signature shall have the same legal effect as it made under oath.
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From: ‘ "co‘r'phefp" <corphelp@mail.dos. state.fi.us>
To: “david goldis™ <cg-accounting@mindspring.com> ~

Sent: Thursday, November 02, 2000 4:27 PM

Subject: RE: Infomercial Funding Group Inc.- P98000021752 .
As you have stated that the corporation did not receive the report notices,
you may submit a letter providing this information to our office with a“
completed report form and the $150 fee. The dissolution will be removed if
you follow these steps .
Jennifer

Internet Access

----- Original Message-—-—.. _ — e

From: david goldis [mailto: cg-accountmg@mlndsprmg com]
Sent: Thursday, November 02, 2000 4:13 PM

To: corphelp@mail.dos.state.fl.us

Subject: Infomercial Fundlng Group Inc.- P99000021752

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayef. My client never
received the annual report for 2000, and never realized that it wasn't
received. They changed addresses during the year and obviously none of the
- reports were. forwarded. We would like to immediately send in the report

together with the original fee of $150. We would apprec1ate an abatement of

the penalty
Thank you.

. David Goldis ,

CG Accounting Corp.

Office (954) 327-4617

Fax (954)327-4618 L
Tocg- accountmg@mmdsnrmg com <mailto: cg-accountmg@mmdsprmg com>
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CG Avonniing Co@bomz’zon

4101 Raventsaood Rod, Ssie 111, Fort Lancriiah, F1. 33312 (954) 3274617 Fuoc (954) 3274618

December 8, 2000

Division of Corporations
Annual Report / Reinstatement Section
PO Box 6327

Tallahassee, FL 32314-6327

Re: Infomercial Finding Group Inc.
# 99000021752
2000 Annual Report

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. This.corporation nevet
received their annual report in the mail. We sent an e-mail (copy enclosed) to
advise us how to proceed.

We are submitting the application for reinstatement togéthet with the $150 fee.

We appreciate the abatement of the late fee.
If any additional information is needed, please contact us.

Very truly yours,

1

David Goldis
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