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Dunlap, Andy

From: corphelp

Sent: Thursday, October 28, 1999 8:16 AM
To: Dunlap, Andy

Subject: FW. Annual fee

Andy,

Here it is!

You may need to respond, telling them that the documen! has been filed but we are showing no record of the 2nd check
submitted.

Sammy
Internet Access

-----Original Message-----

From: Mzinninti@aol.com [mailto:Mzinnint@aol.com)
Sent: Wednesday, October 27, 1999 5:10 PM

To: corphelp@mail.dos. state. fl.us

Subject: Annual fee

Dear Sirs,

My name is Marianne Zinn, officer for K&N - Knowledge and Networking, Inc.
FEI number: 65-0793944
Re: P97000086914

The reason for this e-mail is that on July 1, 1999 | sent a letter o the
Secretary of State, Division of Corporations. There it was mentioned that we
never received the original Corporation Annual report mailed earlier in the
year. After receiving the second notice, our accountant called the secretary
of state when he was 1old to write a letter explaining the situation and
include a check valued at US$150.00.

Well, the letter and check were sent on July 1, 1999. You must have received
both because my check was cashed and | have it back from the bank.

Therefore, we would appreciate to be notified that our corporation is in good
standing and reinstated.

Please either answer this e-mail, call us at (614) 932-9330 or call our
accountant, Mr. Ignacio Abella at (305) 823-7579.

Sincerely,

Marianne Zinn

President.

Tel: (614) 932-9330

Fax: (614) 932-9336
e-mail: mzinnint@aol.com




