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FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE
Katherine Harris
Secretary of State

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS

DOCUMENT # $47000037(0Y

1. Corporation Nama

Drestige Viagnostic Associates Tnc.

7. Name and Address of Current Registered Agent

Name

1
) %o Na X
Street Address (P.O. Box Number is Not Acceptable)

4594 A, Weatus Read

Suite, Apt. #, Etc.

8. |, being appointed the registered agent of the above named corporation, am famitiar with and accept the obligations of section 807.0505 or 617.0503, F.S.

Signature of '
Rggistered Agentx Date 7/’&/0 ‘

REGISTERED AGENT MUST SIGN

2. Principal Office Address 5. Mailing Office Address ,
4594 N. Riabus Read [¥59Y A, Hictoo Road
Suite, Apt. #, etc. “Suite, Apt. #,etc. T I -
4. Date Incorporated or Qualified E
To Do Business in Florida / /
City & State City & State 2 V d' 7 i
6 FL 6 . F(— §. FEI Number Applied For
Un ' \Se, ‘auny \52— g 5 0759 968 Not Applicable {
: 2 s g 4 = o 8 ceRTFICATE OF STATUS DESIRED (] $8.75 Agiionai oo foquirec
5 \ . U 3 55 6 | U 5A — for a Cerificate of Status

City State Zip Code
Suncise — N FL | 3335( E ]

-~
9. Names and Street Addresses of Each Officer and/or Directar (Florida nonprofit corparations must list at least 3 directors)

; . Nameof . Street Address of Each J . )
Titles Officers and/or Directors - " Officer and/or Director Clty / State / Zip

'7’5‘?% . Hialos Road .
p Por'l:'»“o: Bc"\\la\f SUA(‘;SQ, FL 3335(

Y |Azzinave, Goy Y599 M. Hiatos Read  [Sunvice, FL 3335(

- — T =
10. | certify that  am an officer or director ot the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this application as provided for in chapter 607 or 817, F.S. | further certify that when filing
this reinstatement application, the reason for dissolution has been eliminated, the corporate name satisfies the requirements of section 807.0401 or 617.0401, F.S., that all fees

owed by the corporaticn have been paid and the names of individuals listed on this form do not qualify for an exemption under section 119.07(3)(i), F.S. The information indicated
on this application is true and accurate, and my signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath.

Qolivac Poctille 2)icloy  95Y-7¥8-9090

‘SIGNATURE AND wanEﬂM’?ﬁmm OFFICER OR DIRECTOR Dale Daytime Phone #

SIGNATURE:

CR2E081 {3/00}
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< .. 0w

David Goldis ;
[

' i
From: “corphelp" <corphelp@mail.dos.state.fl.us> '
To: "David Goldis™ <cg-accounting@mindspring.com> |
Sent: Thursday, July 12, 2001 3:53 PM {

Subject: RE: Prestige Diagnostic Associates -

You may reinstate a corporation that has been administratively dissolved. To
reinstate, an application for reinstatement must be completed and submitted
to this office with the appropriate fees. Reinstatement forms can be
downloaded or ordered to be received by mail from our webpage at:

www.sunbiz.org. Click on "Obtain Filing Forms". Choose "Download Forms" - or

- "Forms By Mail". If you choose "Download Forms," on the next page select
"Fiorida Corporations (Profit and NonProfit)" and then select '
"Profit/NonProfit Reinstatement.” If you choose "Forms By Mail", fill out

the request form and select whichever form(s) you need. Click on "SUBMIT".
We will get your request and fill it promptly. You may call (850)245-6059
concerning reinstatement fees. Please inform them that the corporation did
not receive the report notices, so that they may instruct you on the correct
fees and what to submit with your reinstatement form.

Jennifer
Internet Access

----- Original Message-----

From: David Goldis [mailto:cg-accounting@mindspring.com]
Sent: Thursday, July 12, 2001 3:41 PM

To: corphelp

Subject: Prestige Diagnostic Associates - P97000037104

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. My client never
received the UBR for 2000 or 2001, and never realized that it wasn't

received. We would like to immediately send in a reinstatement UBR together
with the fee of $300, for the two years. We would appreciate an abatement of
the penalty '

Thank you.

David Goldis

"CG Accounting Corp.
Office (954) 327-4617
Fax (954)327-4618

cg-accounting(@mindspring.com <mailto:cg-accounting(@mindspring.com>

/122001



