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2003 FOR PROFIT CORPORAT

UNIFORM BUSIN

D?CUMENT #P95000025923
DOMINION BUSINESS SUPPLIES, USA INC.

-«

ESS REPORT fUBR)
(L g

Principal Piace of Business

203& NE 155 ST
N MIANI BEACH, FL 33162

Malling Adcress

2036 NE 155 5T
N RIANI BEACH, FL 33162

FILED

Aug 14,2003 8:00 am
Secretary of State

08-14-2003 90068 006 ***150.00

80138445

R 0 A

2. Principal Place of Business 3 Mafing Adoress
=T Suile- Apt 2 alc—— - T B A, R A S e T S ) GHECK FERE IF MARING CHANGES ™"

City & State Ctty & Stale 4. FE) Number Applied For

65-0880108 Not Applicable
Tp - Country Zip Country $8.75 additional
B. Certificale of Status Desired (] Foo Requirod
6. Name and Addi of & gl d Agent 7. Name and Address of New Reglatersd Agent
Name

TUFFNEY, NICHOLAS

2036 NE 185 ST

Streel Aooress {P.O. Box Number |s Nol Acceplable)
N MIAMI BEACH, FL 33182

Gity

FL |ﬂ°°°°°

8. The above narned entily submits this stalement for the purpose of changing 15 reagistered office or regisiered agent, of both, In the State of Florids. 1 am familiar with, and accent
the obligations of registerad agent. »

SIGNATLRE
Bymawm, mmpnmmdmmuumuiwm INOTE: DATE
9. Election Campaign Finanging 35 00 mayBe
Trust Fund Contribution. dad to Foas.
10, QFFICERS AND DIRECTORS 11, ADDIMONS/CHANGES TO OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS IN 11
me P O Deiete TiILE Othnge [Jaddtien | &
NANE TUFFNEY, NICHOLAS s g
SwEE abbagss | 2036 NE 168 ST STREET ADDRESS §
ciY-51.2P N MIAMI BEACH, FL 33132 oyt &
ImE [ Deleie “HILE O Clenge [ Additen %
HAME NAME
SIREET ADDAESS STRETALORESS
oY 5T. 1P £Ov-ST-1P :
the [ Ceiee 113 [1Change [ Additon
RANE . [T
- | STREETADLESS St e aettad emiam e o - I SIREET ADORESS , , . . R
CTY-§1-IP £oy.51-2p
me O Deiee e Ochenge [ Mddiion
N NAME
STEET ADDRESS STREEY ADDRESS
511 (1 -5
e O Deer ILE {JCrarge [ Additon
MANE RAE
SHEE ADDHESS STREET ADDRESS |- ST
cY-5T-29 cav.st-oe
me [ Deler 2] Dtrege [ Addiion
NAME NAME
STREET ADDWESS STREENADORESS
Cme.s1.2p cmy-st-1P

2.1 hmnyoomz ihat the information supptied with lhlsnllng does nutqualmriormexempughnjlnuc in Socbon 1193? X1 Flﬁndaﬂs‘tm:; Ilu”r‘ll-n':‘r::rﬂl\/ that the Irforrnation
i o lgmental r urete and that my signature have the a3 i made under oal arn sn officer or direcior
Ln'ulcllec o mpo e In? o e rmlhls reporl";ys rgqulred by Chapter 807, Flon':gstamu. ano thal My name appears in Slock 10 of Block 11 1f

m
changed, or on =" machmom wllh an acorgss. with all oiher like empowered.

SIGNATURE!:

MGMATURE AND TYPED

EDNAME OF SIGNING

5 Tu-g neY

703103 95433183

n




Whehes 701350
CG _Aconrizng Conporation

4101 Ravensanod Road, Suit 111, Fort Lanckrela, FL. 33312 (954) 3274617 Farc (954) 3274618
July 17, 2003

Uniform Business Report
Division of Corporations
PO Box 1500

Tallahassee, FL 32302-1500

~Re: Domini
H# PY5000025923 -

siness Supplies USA Inc.

o e N e B e ey e L

Dear State of Florida Representative,

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. This cotporation never
received their 2003 UBR in the mail. We sent an e-mail and received a response
(copy enclosed) to advise us how to proceed.

We are submitting the application tbgethet with the $150 fee. We appreciate the
abatement of the late fee.

If any additional information is needed, please contact us. .

Very truly yours,
David Goldis

DTG/cb




/%%MWWL | puge 1 of 1

David Goldis | KBIRI YU

From: "corphelp" <corphelp@dos.state.fl.us>

To: "David Goldis™ <cg-accounting@mindspring.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2003 2:24 PM

Subject: RE: Dominion Business Supplies USA - P95000025923

You can make a written request for a waiver of the late fee. Attach the request to a completed
UBR, and submit with $150. The request will be reviewed, but it is not a guarantee the request will
be honored. If the late fee is required, you will receive a letter advising so.

Leslie Sellers
Internet Access

_ From: David Goldis [mallto cg- accountmg@mlndspnng corn] '
~Sent: Wednesday, July 09,2003 2:14 PM e : ———— —_
To: corphelp :

Subject: Dominion Business Supplies U

- P95000025923

X PN client never received the original UBR for 2003, and
never realized that it wasn't received. We would liké tg |mmed1ately send in a new UBR together with the fee of
© $150. We would appreciate an abatement of the penalty.

Thank you.

David Goldis

CG Accounting Corp.
(954) 327-4617

(954) 327-4618 fax
david@cg-accounting.com

This email is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is
addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or
otherwise exempt from disclosure under applicable law. [f the reader of
this email is not the intended récipient or the employee or agent
responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this

- communication in error, please immediately notify us by telephone and return
-.. the original message to.us at the listed email address. Thank You.
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