2005 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION

DOCUMENT # P94000000088

1. Entity Name »

MARTHA GARCIA-BAKER, C.P.A, PA.

FILED
05 00T -5 pi 2 4

Principal Place of Business Mailing Address S reme e

2210 N.W. 20TH TERRACE 2210 N.W. 20TH TERRACE ' SRAT N
GAINESVILLE, FL 32605 GANESVILLE, FL 32605 UJ 000 QQ, $%0.(J0

R s o | lll|||lll Iﬂllllllllllﬂll\ll AR

Sulte, Apt. #, etc. Suite, Apt. #, elc. 10022005  REIN-P CR2E098 (6/04)
City & State City & State 4. FEI Number Applied For
59-3215891 Not Applicable
Zip Country Zp Cauntry 5. Certificate of Status Desived [ fg:?qg‘g‘i""a'
6. Name and A of Current Regi d Agenl 7. Name and Address of New Reglstered Agent
Nameg
CAPITAL CONNECTION INC.
417 E. VIRGINIA STREET Street Address (P.C. Box Number is Not Acceptable)
STE. 1
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32301
City FL | Zip Code

8. The above narmed entity submits ihis staternent for the purpose of changing its registerad office or registered agent, or bath, in the State of Florida. | am familiar with, and accept
the obligations of registered agent.

SIGNATURE

are, typad o pentad nama ol registored agent and titie if applicable (NOTE: Registersd Agent signature requirad when reinziating) DATE

FILE NOWII! FEE IS $750.00
After Jarnaary 1, 2006, Fee will be $900.00

10. OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS 1. ADDITIONS/CHANGES TO OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS IN 11

TITLE DPT [ oetete TILE [ change [ Addition
NAME GARCIA-BAKER, MARTHA NAME

STREET ADDRESS | 2210 N.W. 20TH TERRACE STREET ADDRESS

CITY-ST-71P GAINESVILLE, FL Ciy-51-2°

TILE VS [T pelete TIHE [Jcrange [ Addition
RAME BAKER, STEPHEN P. NAME

STREET ADDRESS | 2210 NW 20 TERRACE STREET ADDRESS

CITY-ST-2P GAINESVILLE, FL CITY-ST-2IP

TILE O pelete THLE [ change [T Addition
NAME NAME

STREET ADDRESS STREET ADOIRESS

CITY-51-ZP CITY-51-7P

TITLE [ Defete TITLE Ochange [ Addition
NAME NAME

STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS

QITY-ST-7IP CITY-ST-7IP

TILE 1 belete e NN P g ge [ Addition
NAME NAME i

STREET ADORESS STREET ADDRESS

CITY-57-2ZP CITY-§7-2P

it O Dpetete TILE [ Change [ Addition
NAME NAME

STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS

CITY-5T-2P e CY-ST-2P

12. | hereby certify that the information supplied with this fiing does rot qualify for the exemption stated in Section 119.07(3)(i), Florida Statutes, { further certify that the information
indicated on this repor or supplemeptal report is lrue and acgurate and that my signatuse shall have the same legal effect as it made under oath; that | am an officer or director
of the corporation or the repeiver gfArusiee empowered o glecute thl?s required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears in Block 10 or Block 11§

arunes /2ol ) Sritia Bophor (o thabaccia- biber) Ty 332:3734

SIGNATURE:
’ /hcumzmmoﬂmmwmmmmonmm Duylme Prona #

~

7



Page 1 of 2

— -

From: "Milligan, Michelle" <MMilligan@dos.state.ft.us>

To: "csbaker@acceleration.net™ <cshaker@acceleration.net>

Subject: RE: Document Numter PS4000000088 Martha Garcia-Baker CPA, PA

Date: Wed, 28 Sep 2005 09:13:30 -0400 "

X-Mailer: Internet Mail Service (5.5.2658.3)

X-Spam-Flag: NO

X-Spam-Status: No, hits=-4.89 required=4.00 tests=BAYES_00,NO_RDNS2

X-Spam-Level:

X-Spam-Score: -4.89

X-Spam-Checker-Version: SpamAssassin 3.0 (1.3) on oni.acceleration.net

Thank you for your request that has been forwarded to me for response.

It appears that your registered agent "Capital Connection, Inc." resigned on
June 30, 2005. You submitted your 2005 annual report and check(s) totaling
$550.00, however the annual report was not filed and was returned for
corrections on July 12, 2005. Your annual report indicated Capital
Connection as your registered agent, but because they had previously
resigned, we retummed the document requesting that you designate a new
registered agent. On July 13, a change of registered agent application was
submitted designating Capital Connection as your registered agent.
Unfortunately, our records do not indicate receiving your corrected annual
report back, resulting in the administrative dissolution that occurred on
09/16/05.

To reinstate your corporation, you must complete a reinstatement application
which can be downloaded from our website-at www sunbiz.org or one.can be.
mailed to you. . The fee to reinstate the corporation is $750.00 leaving you

a balance due of.$200.00.

Please feel free to contact me with any questions.
Sincerely,
Michelle Milligan

Document Specialist Supervisor
850-245-6027 phone
850-245-6017 fax

-—-Original Message—-

From: Coulliette, Cheryl

Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2005 8:17 AM

To: Milligan, Michelle

Subject: FW: Document Numter P94000000088 Martha Garcia-Baker CPA, PA

—-0Qriginal Message—
From: spbaker [mailto:csbaker@acceleration.net}

Sent: Saturday, September 24, 2005 11:50 AM
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