_© " PLEASE READ ALL INSTRUCTIONS BEFORE COMPLETING T»y@ %”iﬁ. )

CORPORATION PSR FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE
REINSTATEMENT % Secretary of Siate 33 O{\T - 3 R .f 50
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS
SOCUMENT#  Ploocod 2953
1. Corporstion Nama
TWAY ENTERPRISES, INC.
Z. " Principal Oice Address - No P.O. Box # 3. Wailing Office Address
101 Solano Woods Drive {101 Solano Woods Drive
S AR E, W - g CR2B0O81 {11/10)
L AT (TR e T
temesw ng;'; g:omu in Florida
1)
[Ponte Vedra, FL. Ponte Vedra, FL. 7 360197 v
[ Coufitry” Cou-l.'ry B 75 Addianal Feeagened
32082 USA. 32082 U.S.A. CERTFICATE OF STATUS DESIRED . ST
7. Nama and Addrets of Current Ronisuud Agant
[RaE
KEITH H. JOHNSON, Esquire =0
sl Adgess [P0 Box NiFibar & Not ACceplabis) P SoOo2S23easT
8810 Goodbys Executive Drive ID.#DS/ 13~—[ﬁ 033--011 *r*BBDU.l}D
Ste A 4 - .
: S EEO=T
THY Stts" P20 ; -

8. 1, being sppoitted {he registersd agent of the above named corporation, & familar with and accept the obligations of saction 607.0605 or 817.0503, F.S.

Regmenargent __ et 1 1te d“d

REGISTERED AGENT MUST SIGN

Date

g, and Street Add dEmmmDM(anmrmmmmwmman)

Name of Street Address of Each ;
Tiies ©Officers and/or Diectors Officer and/or Direcior Cily / State / Zip

PSTD PAUL S. TWAY 101 Solano Woods Drive|Ponte Vedra, FI. 32082

REINSTATEMENT W3

R. HUNT
0. E-mail Address; keith-@icomcast.net / sooittway@gmsit.com
{To b t%ad TOF FUTUre £NUR] repon RoLTCaTION)
20 this ApPRCRLion &3 providod Tr n Chapkor 607 o1 617, F 5. | Rathex cartly mal whon Wiy e

, the corporate name satisfies the requiremonts of saction 6070401 or §17.0401, £ 5., and that al fees
mmmmhwwmummmm mmmmmaﬂmammmus
ejorty B3 provided for in &.817.155, F.S.

SIGNATURE: 10l7e%

G04-534-18937 (ceh}




) OMB Ng_ 1545
farm 2 848 Power of Auomay For IRS UL?OJ'?ILSO
(Rev. March 2012) and Declaration of Representative Racatvad by
3-"&';':?{'-.:&' m » Typo or print. » See the separate instructions. Name

Powar of Attorney Teiaphane
Cautlon: A separate Form 2848 should be compleled for aach taxpayer. Form 2848 will nal be honored Funclion
for any purposs ather than representation before the IRS. Oate Y
1 Taxpoyes Information. Taxpayer must sign and date this form on page 2, lina 7.
Taxpayer name and nddrass Taxpayer identification number{s}
TWAY ENTERPRISES, INC. 27~-3663127
%8[}1 Tgor‘;gggchgES g g (I)gg Daytime telephone number Plan number (if appficable)
hereby appaints the following representative(s) as attornay{s)in-fact:
2 Repreventative{s) must sign and date this form on page 2, Part 1.
Name and address CAFNo, .....23058-38824R ..
KEITH H. JOHNSON PIN _........E00QL11061 .
8810 GOODBY'S EXECUTIVE DR STE A TelephoneNo.  .{904). 737-5930
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32217 FaxNo. ......[204) 737=5966 .
Check if to be ssnt notices and communications P Check if new: Address [} Telsphone No. || Fax No. | |
Neme and address cAFNo. ... .0305-22840R .
ADAM L. HEIDEN PIIN oo EO1I0564873 . ..
BB10 GOODBY'S EXECUTIVE DR STE A Tetephoneno.  .(204)_ 137-5930 .
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32217 FaxNo. _.....[204). 737-5966 .
Check i to be asnt notices and communications [ Check If new: Addresa | ] Talephone No. || FaxNo. [ ]
Name and address CAF No. ... 4 3.C.'.§" 51 6‘.1.%9‘
RENEE 1. MANKUS PTIN __P01056479
BB10 GOODBY'S EXECUTIVE DR STE A Telephone o, (904) 737-5830
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32217 Fax No. (904) 737-5966

Chack if new: Addrass D Talephone No. m
to reprasent the taxpayer before the Internal Revanue Service for the following matiers:

3 Matisrs
Description of Matter (income, Empioyment, Peyral, Exciss, Estate, Gift, Whistiablowor, Tax Form Number Year(s) or Period(s) (if epplicabie)
Practitioner Disclpling, PLR, FOIA, Civii Panalty, eto.) (sea instructicns for lins 3) {1040, 841, 720, etc.) (if applicable) {sae ingtructions for ling 3)
INCOME 1126/11208 2010 THROUGH 2014
S ELECTION 2553 2010 THROUGH 2014
EMPLOYMENT 940 2010 THROUGH 2014
EMPLOYMENT 941 05/30/10-12/31/14

4 Spacific uca not recorded on Cantratized Authorization Fite {CAF). If the power of alfornay is for a specific usa not recorded on CAF,
chack this box. Ses the nstructions for Line 4. Specific Uses NotRecorded onCAF. . . 0 . v v v i v it v ennwsnane. ¥ ]

§  Acts suthorized. Unless otherwise provided below, the reprasantatives generally area authorizad to recaive and inspect confidential tex
information and to parform any and all acts that | can perform with respect 10 the tax mattars described on Line 3, for exarnpie, the autherity to
aign any agresments, consents, or other documents. The representative(s), however, is {are) not authorized to receive or nagotiate any
amounis paid to the clieat In connaction with this representation (including refunds by sither eloctronic means or paper checks). Additionally,
unless (he appropriate box(es) below ars checked, the reprasantative(s) is (are) not authorized o exscute a request for disglosure of 1ax returns
or raturn information to @ third party, substitule another represantative or add additional represeritatives, or sign certain tax retums.

(X pisciosure to thirg parties; (X substiate or add representative(s); O Signing a refum;

D Qther acts authorized:

{see instructions for more information)

Exceptions. An unanrolisd return preparer cannot sign any docurnent for a taxpayer and may only represent laxpayers in Bmited situations.
An antolled actuary may anly represent taxpayars to the extent provided in section 10.3(d) of Treasury Departmant Clrcular Mo, 230 (Clreular
230). An snrolled retirement pan agent may only represent taxpayers to the exient provided in seclion 10.3(a} of Circular 230. A registersd tax
rotum preparar may only reprasent taxpayers to the extent provided in section 10.3{f) of Circular 230. See the line 5 instructions for restirictions
on {ax malters partnars. In most cases, the student practitionar's (Jevel k) authority Is limited {for example, they may only practice under the
supervision of another practiticner).

List any specific deletions to the acts otherwise authorized In this power of attomey:

A Eb N A E T EEEE RN ATy hdh rdecn mmmmmm—n yr g Nt n ey e mmnmmnrraaa e Am ey

For Privacy Act and Paperwork Reduction Act Notica, see the Instructions. Form 2848 (Rev, 2-2012)
DXA
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‘ L

Form 5% (Rw.3201) TWAY ENTERPRISES, INC. 27-3663127 Page 2

6 Retentionfrevocation of prior power{s) of attorney. The filing of this power of attomay automatically revokes all sarlier powerts) of
attomey on file with the intasnal Revenve Service for the seme matters and years or pariods covered by this document. i you do not want
fo revoke o priorpowerafattormney, Check NBME . o . 4 s 4 v s v v s o b v s v st s Pt s i et *D
YOU MUST ATTACH A COPY OF ANY POWER OF ATTORNEY YOU WANT TO REMAIN (N EFFECT.

7  Signature of taxpayer. !f 2 1ax matter concarns a yaar In which a joint return was filad, the husband and wife mus! each file a separate powst
of ettomey aven if the same representative(s) Is (are) being appainted. if signed by a corporate officar, paitner, guardian, tax matters panner,
axacutor, recoiver, administrator, or trustee on behalf of the taxpayer, | cartify that | have the authority to execute Lhis form on behalf of the
taxpaysr,

T SIGNED AND DATED, THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY WILL BE RETURNED TO THE TAXPAYER.

PAUL SCOTT TWAY oocad

T TWAY ENTERPRISES, INC.
Print Name PIN Number

Print name of {axpeyer from ne | W othor than ndividual

BN  Declaration of Representative
Under penaltias of parjuty, | declare that:
# I am not currently under suspension or disbament from practice befors the Internal Revenue Setvice;
[ am eware of ragutations contained In Circular 230 (31 CFR, Part 10), as amendad, concerning practice befors the Intemal Revenue Servite,
# | am authorizad to represent the taxpayer identified in Par | for the matter(s} specified there; and
* } am one of the following:
a Aftemey - a mamber in good standing of tha bar of the highast court of the Jurladiction ahown below,
Cartified Public Accountant - duly qualified to practice as a cenified public accountant in the Jurisdiction shown below.
Enrolied Agsnt - enrolled as an agent under the requirements of Cireular 230.
Officer - a bona fide officer of the taxpayers organization.
Full-Tims Employee - a fulidime employes of the taxpayer.

Family Member - a member of the texpayer's immediate family (for example, spousa, parant, child, grandparent, grandchiid, step-parant, step-
¢hild, brother, or aister).

g Enratigd Actuary - snrofled as an actuasy by the Joint Board for the Enraliment of Actuarias under 22 U.S.C. 1242 (the authorily to practice before
the Inteingl Revenue Service Is limited by section 10.3(d) of Circular 230).

h Unenrolied Return Praparer - Your authority to practice before the |nternal Revenua Servica I5 imited. You must have been eilgible to sign the
raturs under examination and have signed the retum, See Notice 2011-6 and Special rules for repistered tax retumm preparwrs and unenrolied
return preparers in ithe instructions.

i Registered Tax Retum Preparer - registorad as a tax ratusn praparer under the reguirements of section 10.4 of Circular 230. Your authority to
practice before the Intemnal Revenue Service is imited. You must have been efigible 1o sign the retum under examination and have signed the
return. Sae Notice 2011-6 and Special rules for registered tax return proparers and unentolied retum preparers in the instructions.

% Studenl Attomey or CPA - receives permission to practice before the RS by vitue of hisMer status ag & law, business, or accounting student
working in LITC or STCP under section 10.7{d) of Circular 230. See instructions for Part || for addiliona! information and requirements,

r Encclied Retiramant Plan Agend - anrolisd as g ratirement plan agent under the requiraments of Gircular 230 (the authority to practice baefore the
Internat Ravenua Servica s limited by secsion 10.3(e)).

» iF THIS DECLARATION OF REPRESENTATIVE IS NOT SIGNED AND DATED, THE POWER OF ATTORNEY WILL BE
RETURNED. REPRESENTATIVES MUST SIGN IN THE ORDER LISTED IN LINE 2 ABOVE. See the instructions for Pari 1.

Nota: For designations o1, enter your title, position, or 7elationship to the taxpayer in the “Licensing jurisdiction” column. See the instructions for Fart
11 far mors information.

- & o o6 o>

Bar, licanse, cartification,
Licansing jurisdiction registration, or
Designation - Insert {state) or other enrollment number
gbove latter (ar) | licensing autherity |  (f applicabla). See Signature Date
(if applicable) Instructions for Part [l for
more information. N\,
a /6 FLORIDA 0342939 / o GO 1D
a FLORIDA 0050817 @i (1013
— -
b FLORIDA | £C0024075  |dmgnic oo — L-16-13
DA Form 2848 [Rev. 3-2012)



( JOHNSON anp JOHNSON, PA

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

8810 GOODBY'S EXECUTIVE DRIVE, SUITE A
JAGKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32217
9804} 737-5930 - Fax [604) 137-5966

www fohnsonandjobnsonpa.com

KEITH H. JOHNSON R. DENISE JOHNSON
BOARD CERTIFIED TAX ATTORNEY ATTORNEY AT LAW
CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT

ADaM L. HEIDEN
CHRISTINE M. JONES ATTORNEY AT Law
ATTORNEY AT LAW CERTIEIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT
MASTER OF LAWS [LL.M ) TAXATION

RENEE L. MANKUS

CERILFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT

September 30, 2013

VIA CERTIFIED U.S. MAIL

Division of Corporations
Post Office Box 6327
Tallahassee, Florida 32314

Re: ~ Fway Enterprises, Inc.
FEIN: 27-3663127

Subject: Reinstatement
Dear Sir/Madam:

We write regarding the reinstatement of Tway Enterprises, Inc., on behalf of our client, Paul S. Tway, and
his company, Tway Enterprises, Inc.

For the foregoing purpose, we are enclosing for your review the following:

1. Form CR2E081, Corporation Reinstatement form

2. Client's check Ne, 1219 in the amount of $450.00 reflecting payment of the $150.00 annual
fee for 2011, 2012, and 2013; '

3. Client’s check Ne. 1218 in the amount of $600.00 representing the reinstatement fee;

4, Form 2848, Power of Attorney, Tway Enterprises, Inc.

Should you have any questions or require any additional information, please do not hesitate to call.

Keith H. Jo.hnson
KHI:rks

Enclosures
As Stated (4)

c: Paul S. Tway, Vice President
Tway Enterprises, Inc.



