2009 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT M FII(_)ED2009
DOCUMENT# P0O5000025942 Secrt‘;l ary of State

Entity Name: HARDEMAN REALTIME, INC.

Current Principal Place of Business: New Principal Place of Business:
7901 42 STREET NORTH

PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 US

Current Mailing Address: New Mailing Address:

7901 42 STREET NORTH
PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 US

FEI Number: 20-2420068 FEI Number Applied For { ) FEI Number Not Applicable ( ) Certificate of Status Desired (X)

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent: Name and Address of New Registered Agent:
HARDEMAN, GAYL

7901 42ND ST. N.
PINELLAS PARK, FL 337810896 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both,
in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE:

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent Date

Election Campaign Financing Trust Fund Contribution { ).

OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS: ADDITIONS/CHANGES TO OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS:
Title: P ( ) Delete Title: ( ) Change { ) Addition
Name: HARDEMAN, GAYL Name:

Address: 7901 42ND STREET NORTH Address:

City-St-Zip:  PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 City-St-Zip:

Title: S ( ) Delete Title: ( ) Change ( ) Addition
Name: HARDEMAN, GAYL Name:

Address: 7901 42ND STREET NORTH Address:

City-St-Zip:  PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 City-St-Zip:

Title: T ( ) Delete Title: ( ) Change ( ) Addition
Name: HARDEMAN, GAYL Name:

Address: 7901 42ND STREET NORTH Address:

City-St-Zip:  PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 City-St-Zip:

Title: D ( ) Delete Title: ( ) Change { ) Addition
Name: HARDEMAN, GAYL Name:

Address: 7901 42ND STREET NORTH Address:

City-St-Zip:  PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 City-St-Zip:

Title: v ( ) Delete Title: ( ) Change ( ) Addition
Name: KLUTZOW, MICHAEL Name:

Address: 7901 42ND STREET NORTH Address:

City-St-Zip:  PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 City-St-Zip:

Title: D ( ) Delete Title: ( ) Change { ) Addition
Name: KLUTZOW, MICHAEL Name:

Address: 7901 42ND STREET NORTH Address:

City-St-Zip:  PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781 City-St-Zip:

| hereby certify that the information supplied with this filing does not qualify for the exemption stated in Chapter 119, Florida
Statutes. | further certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my
electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that | am an officer or director of the corporation or
the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears
above, or on an attachment with an address, with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: GAYL HARDEMAN P 05/08/2009
Electronic Signature of Signing Officer or Director Date
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Shoffstall, Lyn \ﬂf}Cbe,h f{'a 29 # /HC 05/ 08 [07

From: Kassees, Jay
Sent: Monday, May 11, 2009 1:15 PM
To: Shoffstall, Lyn

Subject: FW. Jay, who should respond? ) - .
’ i T s 1 ssuld

Please look into this and resclve. Thx, ik

Please take a few minutes to provide feedback on the quality of service you received from our staff. The Fiorida Department of
State values your feedback as a customer, Kurt Browning, Florida’s Secretary of State, is commitied to continuously a2ssessing and
improving the level and quality of services provided to you. Simply click on the link to the "DOS Customer Satisfaction Survey.”
Thank you in advance for your participation. DOS Customer Safisfaction Suovay .

From: Sclomon, Melanie

Sent: Monday, May 11, 2005 1:01 PM
To: Kassees, Jay

Subject: Jay, who should respond?

ID: 9906 Date: 5/9/2009 11:23:22 AM

Employee Email: Onlinewebar@dos.state.fl.us Internal: No

1. Overail, how woulid you rate your experience when contacting the
Department of State:
Excellent

2. Was the information you requested found on the Department’'s
Website?

No

If you answered no, please tell us what you were looking for.

1 was not able to pay by credit card; I wrote to linkZ2gov, got a reply later
that day - still could not pay - then had to leave for cut-of-state meetings
- when I returned, still could not pay. 1 have asked to be granted
leniency on the $400 late fee 1 suffered as a result. YES, I should have
done all this before the final day. YES! I had no idea I would encounter
this problem. And next year, I will file MUCH sooner. A difficult and very
costly lesson. Is there ANY way you can lessen that $400 penalty, given
the Web site's problem of accepting credit cards?

3. Was your request for information or services completed within 5
business days or less?
Yes



