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2021_FLORIDA PROFIT CORPORATION AMENDED ANNUAL REPORT FILED
DOCUMENT# P04000005449 Apr 14,2021

Entity Name: RICHARD GUAY CONSTRUCTION INC @ ItD
Current Principal Place of Business:

900 WEST AVE

VAN SEACH, FL 33139 08/11/2021 BM

Current Mailing Address:

16767 PRATO WAY
NAPLES, FL 34110 US

FEl Number: 20-0573212 Certificate of Status Desired: No
Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:
GUATY, RAFAEL

16767 PRATO WAY
MNAPLES, FL 34110 US

The above named entily submils this statemaent for the purposa of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, i tha State of Fionda.

SIGNATURE: RAFAEL GUATY 04/14/2021
Electronic Signature of Registered Agent Date

Officer/Director Detail : o] | I DA R B

Title PRESIDENT

Name GUATY, RICHARD

e o Refunded
had N0 Ao
4p Rle

| heroty certfy that the information mdicated on this report or supplemental report Is i and accurate and (at my elecironc sgnature shall hove the same (ngal sffac! as ./ made undar
outh: that f am an sfficer or direcior of the cOPporation of 1h8 feceiver or rusfee ampowensd (o execuls s mport a5 reawed by Chapler 607, Flonda Statutes: and Mhat My Name APPAArs
abova, or ot an altachment wilt ail olher hke empowared.

SIGNATURE: RICHARD GUATY PRESIDENT 04/14/2021

Electronic Signature of Signing Officer/Director Detail Date
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Mc_l(nigm:ecca "Becky”
I T ]
From: Smith, Kathleen T.
Sent: Thursday, July 29, 2021 10:56 AM
To: King, Deidre R.
Ce: McKnight, Rebecca "Becky"
Subject: FW: OFFICIAL FINAL NOTICE: INTENT TO ADMINISTRATIVELY DISSOLVE OR REVOKE
L18000267286

Please see Mr. Guaty’'s email below,

Thank you,
Kathleesw Smithv
Executive Assistant |
Department of State
Division of Corporations

From: Richard Guaty <photo@richardguaty.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 29, 2021 10:33 AM

To: Smith, Kathleen T. <Kathleen.Smith@dos. myflorida.com>

Subject: Re: OFFICIAL FINAL NOTICE: INTENT TO ADMINISTRATIVELY DISSOLVE OR REVOKE L18000267286

EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAIL. SOURCI:

To whom it may concern,

Thisis Rechard Guaty from RG CREATIVE L1LC: document number is 11 $000267286.

Thave noaathority or affiliation with the company | filed with us seen below and in the attachments:

No Events No Name History

Detail by Document Number

Florida Profit Corparation
RICHARD GUAY CONSTRUCTION INC

Filing information
Document NumberPO4000005449FEI/EIN Number20-0573212Date FiledQ1/07/20045ta1e FLS1atusACTIVE
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Thank you.
RICHARD GUATY
PHOTOGRAPHER / ARTIST
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www richardeuatv.com

@richardguaty
@guatystudios

On Wed, Jul 28. 2021 at 11:55 AM Smith, Kathieen T. <Kathleen.Smith@dos.mvilorida.com> wrote:

Mr. Guaty:

This payment receipt is for the business entity Richard Guay Construction, Inc., and not for RG Creative, LLC. The
document number you have attached is PO4000005449, which is for an amended annual report, which was filed on
April 14, 2021. The annual report for 2021 in the RG Creative, LLC, has not been filed with the Division of Corporations
at this time. Please let me know how | may further assist you.

Thank you,
Kathleew Smithv
Executive Assistant |
Department of State

Division of Corporations

From: Richard Guaty <photo@richardguaty.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 28, 2021 11:34 AM

To: Smith, Kathleen T. <Kathleen.Smith@dos.myflorida.com>

Subject: Re: OFFICIAL FINAL NOTICE: INTENT TO ADMINISTRATIVELY DISSOLVE OR REVOKE L18000267286

EMAIL RECEIVED IFROM EXTERNAL SOURCE

Hi Kathleen.

Thanks for getting back to me.... | have the attached on record. Its not the best reselution but please let me
know if vou cannot see the details.
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Thank you,
RICHARD GUATY
PHOTOGRAPHER / ARTIST

www.richardeuatv.com

www.rgcreative.online

@richardguaty

(@yguatystudios

On Wed, Jul 28, 2021 at 11:20 AM Smith, Kathleen T. <Kathleen.Smithi@dos.mvilorida.com> wrote:

Mr. Guatv:

[ am not currently seeing a record of this filing of document number L 18000267286. Do vou have a receipt
tor the transaction that occurred? Please let me know how | may further assist you.

Thank vou,
Kathleewn Smith
Executive Assistant |
Department of State

Division of Corporations

- From: Administrative Services <AdministrativeServices@DOS. MvFlorida.com>
. Sent: Tuesday, July 27, 2021 10:34 AM
To: Smith, Kathleen T. <Kathleen.Smith@dos.myflorida.com>

4
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* Subject: FW: OFFICIAL FINAL NOTICE: INTENT TO ADMINISTRATIVELY DISSOLVE OR

+ From: Richard Guaty <photo@richardguaty.com>

REVOKE 118000267286

Please see the email below

" Sent: Tuesday. Julv 27, 2021 9:40 AM

To: Administrative Services <AdministrativeServices@DOS . MvFElorida.com>

Subject: Fwd: OFFICIAL FINAL NOTICE: INTENT TO ADMINISTRATIVELY DISSOLVE OR
REVOKE L18000267286

EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCE

Hello,

My records indicate [ paid on 4/14/21 for my annual LLCC report. Im not sure why my account online is

showing otherwise and with a balance around $500.

Can you please advise?

Thank vou.

RICHARD GUATY

PHOTOGRAPHER / ARTIST

www . richarduuaty.com

- www rgereative.online

@richardguaty

@guatystudios
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R FForwarded message ----s-—--

From: <FL_DOS Corporationsdos.state {l.us>

Date: Mon, Jui 26, 2021 at 3:58 PM

Subject: OFFICIAL FINAL NOTICE: INTENT TO ADMINISTRATIVELY DISSOLVE OR REVOKE
18000267286

To: <photof@richardguaty.com>

t Effective July 17, vour 2021 Annual Report has not been filed
with the Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations.

- RG CREATIVE LLC, document number 118000267286, will be administratively
dissolved or revoked by this office if your 2021 Annual Report

is not filed by 5 pm EST on September 24, 2021. Please disrepard

this notice if you have filed the report since July 17, 2021.

Pleasc visit www.sunbiz.org to file your Annual Repornt now and
avoid administrative dissolution or revocation. Filing instructions
1 arc available on the website. and you may pay by credit card,
| check or through a prepaid Sunbiz E-File Account. Al for-profit
~ 1 corporations, limited liability companies, limited partnerships
! l and himited liability limited partnerships will be required to
pay an additional non-negotiable $400 late fee. Non-profit corporations
. arc not subject 1o the $400 late fee.

Under Florida law, all corporations, limited liability companics,
limited partnerships and limited liability limited partnerships
+ | are required to file an Annual Report each vear with the Florida
' Department of State. Annual Reports are due cach year by May
I'st for your business entity 1o maintain an active status with
- the Flonda Department of State.  Your Annual Report is required
to update or confirm our records regardless of whether you need
i to make changes or not. It is not a financial statement,

We encourage vou to file today to avoid dissolution or revocation,
and appreciate your prompt attention to this matter. To file,
click on Annual Report under the Filing Services menu located

© on our home page at www.sunbiz.org.

Florida Department of State
Division of Corporations

Sunbiz.org remains the only official website of the Department
of State. Division of Corporations. You will know you are in
the right place when you see our official Sunbiz.org logo and

. | header identifying the website as an official State of Florida

© 1 website.



