FILED
2007 PO ANNUAL REPORT o Jul 12, 2007 8:00 am

DOCUMENT # P03000124086 Secretary of State

1. Entity Name 3Rk
LEVITT CONSTRUCTION CO. INC. 07-12-2007 90036 007 **130.00

Principal Place of Business
132 TOMAHAWK DR., STE. D-1
INDIAN HARBOUR BEACH, FL 32937

r |
E——— LT

1465 HWY A1A
Suite, AplL. #, etc. Suite, Apt. #, etc. l o ‘ 07092007 Chg-P CR2E034 (12/06)
City & State City & Shale 4. FEI Number Applied For
SATELLIYE ¢l FL 16-1687801 Not Applicabl
Zip Couniry ;ipz_q =y, ﬁl&y URAD| S Coricats of Stus Desies 0 ?gzmm
6. Name and Address of Cunvent Registered Agent 7. Name and Address of Now Registered Agent

Name

GUANDOLO, VICKIE
114 BAYVIEW DR. Street Address (P.0O. Box Number is Not Acceptable)

INDIAN HARBOUR BEACH, FL 32937

City FL Zip Code

8. The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida. | am familiar with, and accept
the obligations of registered agent.

SIGNATURE
) . Iyped or prinked name of regieterad agent and tile it spplcahie. (NOTE: Registared Agent signature reauired when reinstating) DATE
FILE NOWT!! FEE IS $150.00 9. Election Campaign Financing $5.00 MayBe In accordance with s. 607.193(2)(b), F.S., the
Due by September 14, 2007 Trust Fund Contribution. B Addedio Fees corporation did not receive the prior notice.
10. : OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS 1. ADDITIONS/CHANGES TO OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS IN 11
NAME LEVITT, DAVID NAME
STREET ADDRESS | 1465 HWY AtA, STE. 101 STREET ADDRESS
GIFY-ST-2P SATELLITE BEACH, FL 32937 CITY-S1-2P
THE [ Detete TME Ol Change [ Addition
NAME * NAME
STREET ADORESS STREET ADDRESS
ciY-1-2P CITY-ST-2P
TME [ Detete e [ Change [ Addition
NAME NAME
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADORESS
CITy-S7-2P GiTy-ST-29
ILE 3 Detete e [ Change [ Addition
NAME NAME
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS
CiTY-ST-2P CITY-ST- 7P
TIMLE [ Detete TITLE [Jchange  [] Addition
NAME NAME
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS
CIFY-ST-2P CITY-ST-2P
e [ Detete L O Change [ Addition
NAME NAME
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS
ey -T- 1P CITY-ST-2P

12. | hereby certify that the information supplied with this filing does not qualify for the exemptions contained in Chapter 119, Florida Statutes. | further certify that the information
indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my signature shall have the same legal effect as il made under oath; that | am an officer or director
of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered e this report as required by Chapter 607, Flarida Statutes; and that my name appears in Block 10 or Block 11 if
changed, or on an attac t with an address, with like e ed.

A Z_PsT %/3 2007 321-779-0442

CILAMATIIDL .
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ATTACWE
HO[AMTD T
Subj: RE: annual report :ﬁ:/ “?0 () ( /& (/0 g @

Date: 7/9/2007 4:28:49 PM Eastern Daylight Time
From: corpheip@dos.state fl.us
Tor Levco98@aol.com

If you did not receive prior notice to file you can still file online but when the report loads you’ll need to check off
the late fee waiver that is located next to the boid red paragraph.

To access your 2007 Annual Report go to our website www.sunbiz.org and in the upper portion of the
homepage you will see two banners, one is an option to file online using a credit card and the other lets you
download the report to be mailed in with payment.

hanke, M.W?WM %\W : Address A5 onn ﬁa—a_)

Lee Yarbrough
Internet Access
Division of Corporations

From: Levco98@aol.com [mailto:LevcoS8@aol.com]
Sent: Wednesday, July 04, 2007 7:46 AM

To: corphelp

Subject: annual repoit

Recieved a notice of intent to dissolve. | have filed on time since 2004. | did nbt recieve a renewal notice for
2007 for my Corp. Doc # P03000124086, Levitt Construction Co. Inc.

The extra fee amount is a great hardship for our small company. | would never have been [ate if | recieved your
Notice by mail, and would therefor like you to accept the regular fee of $150.00.

The Post Office agreed there has been problems in our area of recieving mail, some changes in their
carriers and some vandalism; they actually remove the mail from our box if we are gone and don't pick it up and
in several cases did not notify us about that.

| file on time for Leveloader inc., Doc. # P060000070329 and that address is
my office at 1465 Hwy A1A, #101, Satellite Bch. FL 32937.

Perhaps that is the address | should use for Levitt Construction Co.too, but | am puzzeled about
having to use the physical business shop instead of my office in home where my paper work is done.

Please help me resolve this situation and get back on track recieving your notices in timely fashion,
and letting me file for the norma! $150.00 fee.

Sincerely , David Blevitt, President

See what's free at AOL.co

Monday, July 09, 2007 America Online: Levco98



