- | FILED
| Sgp 12,2003 8:00 am
ecretary of State

09-12-2003 90100 046 ***150.00

2003 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION

UNIFORM BUSINESS REPORT (UBR) 8014770%

DOCUMENT # P02000107678 / 2, |
1. Entlly Name
BEST SYSTEMS OF FLORIDA, INC. @
Principal Place of Busness Malling Address
3500 SW 43 PLACE 9500 5W 49 PLACE
COOPER CITY, FL 33328-3409 COOPER CITY, FL 33328-3409

Sulte, ApL 4, €ic. Sulie, Apt. 2, 9ic. -

- [J CHECK HERE 7 MAKING CHANGES

| i S DU USRS gt A TN lqgogsj-,,H%__

Zip Couniry Zip Country .75 Additional
r 5. Certificate of Stalu3 Desired a g Roquirad
8. Name and Addl of Current Reglatered Agent 7. Name and Add of New Reg d Agent
Narne -
EZRATY, MAIM
9500 SW 49 PLACE Street Address (P.Q. Box Nuriler i3 Nol Acgeptable)

COOPER CITY, FL 33328

City Fq Zip Code

8. The above narted entity subrits this slatement for the purpose of changing Its regisiered office or registered agent, or both, In the Stale of Florida. | am famttiar with, and sccept
the cpligations of regsiered sgenl.

SIGNATURE
Snalum, lypad or primsd LETG of syl Byan. s ke T applicable. {HOTE: Proyi A i i L ’ oaTE
9. Election Campaign Financing $5.00 mayBo
Trust Fund Contribution. O  Addedio Fees

st e ¥ e
10. QOFFKCERS AND DIIECTOHS 11, ADDITIONSICHANGES TO QFFICERS AND DIRECTORS IN 11
me P } 7 teiee i P 1"' 4 [ Cherge (R Addition | &
s EZRAT!, HAIM Kl !’ : 8
STREETADDRESS | 9500 SW 49 PLACE ‘ SIEETADDRESS g
Cie.s1-2p COQPER CITY, FL 333203409 Cv-51-21F §
me VP O] Dekeie e ve, 8, ¥ Dthoge  Saditon | &
NAME EZRATI, LISAM NANE .
STREEIADORESS | 500 SW 49 PLACE STRED ADDRESS
CIry-51-29 COQPER CITY, FL 333283409 civ-51-2Ik
me [ peke me - Dtrange [ Addten
WaE NAME :
STREEY ADDRESS STREED ADDRESS
c-1-28 . cv-5-21k

S yme [ Deiee e [JCrrge  [SAddton
WA NE , , i
STREET AbbRESS - T T T T TTTT T T O | st aboeess | -
cav-st-zp CaY-S1-1
TmE {2 Dewe - INE . Dimange [ Addiben
NAME AME
STREET ADDRESS : STREET ADDRESS
CI-sT-7¢ CT-SY 2P
TmE 3 Oetee TILE Dicrange [ Addtion
NaME NANE
STREET ADHMESS . SIREET ADDRESS
o528 omv-st-np i
12. | hereby certlly that the inlormalion suppited with this llllnu coes nol quallly for the exemption stated in Section 118.07{3X1). Floriaa Statines. | further certify thal the Inlormanan

indicaled -on this repon or supplememal repor i$ rue and accurakd and that my gignature shall have the same legal a3 If made uhoer oath; thal | am an offiger or
of the corporation of the receiver or trusiee empowered ko execute this 28 réquired by Chapter 807, Florda Swuios, and that my nzme appears In Block 10 or Elock 1 il

changed, or oh An lnachmenlmm &n adcress, with a!l other like

SIGNATURE: Lw%mm “mmmﬁ%m E zrats %f3c>| 03 95Y-243-9007

Ourytima Poone. &




—HHachment
TN
CG_Aczomnting Conporation.

4101 Remensuood Road, Sue 111, Fort Lok, F1 . 33312 (954) 3274617 Faoe (954) 3274618
August 28, 2003

Uniform Business Report
Division of Corporations
PO Box 1500

Tallahassee, FL 32302-1500

Dear State of Florida Representative,

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. This corporation never
received their 2003 UBR in the mail. We sent an e-mail and received a response
(copy enclosed) to advise us how to proceed.

We are submitting the application together with the $150 fee. We appreciate the
abatement of the late fee. '

If any additional information is needed, please contact us.

Very truly yours,
David Goldis

DTG /cb



MtaChment
David Goldis %D\U\W 765

Page 1 of 1

‘From: "corphelp" <corphelp@dos.state.fl.us>
To: <cg-accounting@mindspring.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 28, 2003 3.46 PM

Subject: RE: Best Systems of Florida - #P02000107678 [sls)

If your client did not receive the first notice please have the client attach a letter to the UBR stating so and include the regular filing
fee of $150.00, '

Thanks,
Lee
Internet Access

_ 7-—-Original Message--—-- R,
From:; David Goldis [mailto:cg-accounting@mindspring.com]
Sent: Wednesday, August 27, 2003 3:17 PM

-To: corphelp -
Subject: Best Systems of Florida(- #P02000107678 Esls]

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. My client never received the original UBR for 2003, and never
realized that it wasn't received. This is the first year they need to file the report. We would like to immediately send in a new
UBR together with the fee of $150. We would appreciate an abatement of the penalty.

Thank you.

David Goldis

CG Accounting Corp.
(954) 327-4617

(954) 327-4618 fax

david@cg-accounting.com

This email is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is

addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or

otherwise exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of

this email is not the intended recipient or the employee or agent

responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, you are

hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this

communication is strictly prohibited. 1If you have received this

communication in error, please immediately notify us by telephone and return

the original message-to-us at-the-listed-emait address- Thank You- -~ wr. mrmm mcee 0 e e o

8/28/2003



