12. | hereby certify that the information supplied with this filing does nct qualify for the exemption stated in Section 119.07(3)(i), Florida Statutes. | further cerlify that the information
indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that | am an officer cr director

of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowen
changed, ar on an altachmem with an address itl

SIGNATURE:

Il other like @ wered.

7. QU

1o exacute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears in Block 10 or Block 11 if

/O/Ab [ox

Vsrd’u:;:a }z}en on ?;cmn

Datea

wajm F"i".?u (“' ALy

2003 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION W/ :
UNIFORM BUSINESS REPORT ('UBR) ; ®
DOCUMENT # P02000033112 >
1. Entity Name =
STEVEN ANTHONY, INC. FILED
3 =,
. 3 3
y 03 Nov 21 Ft 300
Principal Place of Business Malling Address
430 ANSIN BLVD. 430C ANSIN BLVD. C ! © CTATE
_HALLANDALE FL HALLANDALE FL Sl’— -‘~- Jh CEORIDA
2. Principat Place of Business ' 3. Mailing Address
101 N. RIVERSIDE DR. 101 N. RIVERSIDE DR.
Suite, Apt. #, elc. Sulte, Apl: #, etc. HERE }F MAKING CHANGES
STE 124 STE 124 B eneck G
City & State City & State 4. FEI Number Applied For
POMPANC BEACH, FL POMPANO BEACH, FL &%~ ° |03-0433823 Not Appiicable
Zip Country Zip Country h - . $8_75 Additional
33062 USA 33062 USA 5. Certificate of Status Desired [ Fee Roquirad
5. Name and Address of Current Registerad Agent 7. Name and Address of New Registered Agent
ANTH "G
-~ EVEN ALONGI
ALONGI, ONY Strpet Addrgss (P, sl is Mot plable}
430—0 ANSIN BLVD.--- -~ — .+ merm e - - - —f%i ﬁf. % fvﬁ‘ﬁ‘gi_ﬁfﬁ) A}Bﬁ";“ =T T
Zip Code
“boMPANO BEACH FL |3366%
8, Tho above named entity sub is staterneny, for the purposg.of changing its reglstered office or registered agem or both, in the State of Florida, 1 am familiar with, and accept
the obllgatlons of registered L. / Z
SIGNATURE /i 0/2,0 / 03
- r;katura_pmﬁdy pnnred name ¥ r eg»Vrsd agem e if apﬂ ceble. (NOTE: Registered Agent signature raquired when reinstating) BATE
FiLE NOW!l! FEE IS $550.00 . o
9. Election Campaign Financing $5.00 may Bo
After September 10, 2003 Fee wlll be $750.00 Trust Fund Centribution. Addéd to Fees
Make Check Payable to Fiorida Department of Stafe
10. OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS T 1. ADDITIONS/CHANGES TO OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS IN 1
THLE President | 'DI(E C‘l’o r [ Delete TITLE [ Change [ Additen | &
HAKE steven NAME =
sTReeT ADORESS | 41O | NW e+ STREET ADDRESS é
e [PernbroKe 'Pmeq EL 23024 Jovsz g
TITLE [ Delete TIMLE [Ochange  [J Additon | G
NAME NAME 1 ) i:_; % I ...' v |i‘:§ r”" '—‘;:’”‘g ;e
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS ey .'.1 --J_{E'ﬂ ¥ 1!‘*8 j JB
ciry-S7-2IP CiTY-ST1-2IP )
TME [ Delete TITLE [J Change  [J Addition
NAME NAME
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS
CITY-$T-2IP CHY-ST-2IP
mE i -or T O Belete TLE T T T = [ Chaige
NAME NAME E n"‘"
STREET ADCRESS STREET ABDRESS -
CITY-S8T-2IP CITY-ST-2IP
TITLE 1 Delete TITLE [ Change (] Addition
NAME NAME
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS "E‘g
CITY-ST-2IP CITY-ST-2IP )
TILE [ Dalete TITLE ] Change  [] Additicn
NAME NAME :
STREET ADDRESS STREET ADDRESS
CTY-ST-2IP GITY-ST-ZIP
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Brigette Kasbar

A"
From: Brigette Ann Kasbar [brigette@jakcompany. com]

Sent:  Friday, October 17, 2003 11:07 AM
Tg';: ‘corphelp’
Subject: RE: ARTISTIC NAILS, INC.-DOCUMENT #P95000074957 & STEVEN ANTHONY, INC.-DOCUMENT #P02000033112

Mike,

&s stated in my prior e-mail, | have made numerous attempts to contact that department via phone without success. Both clients
shecks, UBR reports and a letter from our office explaining the scenario were sent in mid August,

Jlease note, that this was done in August and not prior because they did not receive their first UBR reports until that time. My clients
are anxious to resolve this matter. Kindly contact me via e-mail or phone (954-983-2990) so that we can more rapidly come to a
‘esolution.

Shouid | have my clients fill out another UBR Report and re-issue and mail a check to your attention? | very much appreciate your
1elp Mike! | look forward tc hearing from you soon.

"HANK YOU.. D e - .

rigette Kasbar
*54-983-2990

From: corphelp [mailto:corphelp@dos.state.fl.us]
Sent: Thursday, October 16, 2003 7:59 AM

To: 'Brigette Ann Kasbar'
Subject: RE: ARTISTIC NAILS, INC.-DOCUMENT #P95000074957 & STEVEN ANTHONY, INC.-DOCUMENT #P02000033112

You say in your email that checks were cut bu you don't say if they were mailed. If they checks were mailed
you would need to contact our Uniform Business report section at 1-850-245-6059.

If the checks were never sent you would need to send the reports in with the amount of $150 for each. Also
send a letter breifly explaining the situtation. The wavier of the reinstatement is not may call but the Uniform
Business Report section at 1-850-245-6059.

Mike
Internet Access

R ]

From: Bngette Ann Kasbar [marlto brlgette@jakcompany com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 15, 2003 5:28 PM

To: corphelp@dos.state.fl.us

Subject: ARTISTIC NAILS, INC.-DOCUMENT #P95000074957 & STEVEN ANTHONY, INC.-DOCUMENT
#P02000033112

Dear Sirf/Madam:

| am sending this e-mail because | have attempted numerous times since August to reach your department without

success.
Artistic Nails, Inc. and Steven Anthony, Inc., our two above-referenced clients have both received administrative
dissolution papers.

Neither of these companies received their first UBR Reports until mid August. Upon receipt they immediately

contacted our office and we issued checks in the amount of $150.00 each along with a letter to clarify the reason for
late filing.

Y 17M0NT
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J Kindly, let us know via e-mail (Brigette@jakcompéﬁy.com) or phone (954-983-2980) what steps deed to be taken to
Y resolve this matter.

Thank you for your attention and concern.

Most Sincerely,

" a

Brigette A. Kasbar

) JOHN A. KASBAR & COMPANY, INC.
3880 SHERIDAN STREET
HOLLYWOOD, FL 33021

f e o = e R . . R
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