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PLEASE READ ALL INSTRUCTIONS BEFORE COMPLETING THIS FORM. .

2\ FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE 04 APP
Secretary of State 12 At I:3

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS EC -
F ‘““ J \/

[LAI‘, {‘Cv‘: O}: STAIE
DOCUMENT # P02000029827 FﬁDA

1. Corporation Name

PLEASANT INVESTMENTS INC.

2, Principal Office Address 3. Mailing Office Address e L = om0 %g 4
4900 SARAZEN DRIVE 4900 SARAZEN DRIVE %Eg%g% L"*s sl 03 Ofﬁ .
Sulte, Apt. #, efc, Suite, Apl, #, efc,

4. Date Incorporated or Qualified
.. .. To Do Businass in Flotida 3/49Q/02

| City & State Gity & State
5. FEI Number Applied For
HOLLYWOOQD, FL HOLLYWQOQUD, FL.
65-0835469 Not Applicable
Zip Country Zip Country 5.
33021 USA 33021 USA CERTIFICATE OF STATUS DESIRED [T Kot Jadiiona) Fas required
7. Name and Address of Current Registered Agent
Name
AVERBUCH, MOSHE .
. —SHSSSETTaESS
Strael Agdress (P.O. Box Number is Not Acceptable) G TIE AT S = -
4900 SARAZEN DRIVE 04/15/04--01014--006  #+304. (0
Suite, Apl. #, Elc.
c.g Slate | Zip Code
HOLLYWOQOD FL | 33021
8. 1, being appointed the registered agent of %ﬂ:mtaﬁon, am famillar with and accept the obligations of section 607.0505 or 617.0503, F.5.
Signature of
Flggisterecl Agent Data 3/26/04
REGISTERED AGENT MUST SIGN
9, Names and Streel Addresses of Each Ofticer andior Director (Florida nonprofit corporations must list at least 3 directors)
y N t Strest Add i Each .
Tities Otfticers ar?g:fi? Directors Otl;?ceer ané?gf Blra;gr City / State / Zip
P.,S.T.0{ AVERBUCH, MOSHE 4900 SARAZEN DRIVE HOLLYWOQOQOD, FL 33021

10. | certify that | am an officer or direcior or the recaiver or trustee empowered 1o exacute this application as provided for in chapter 607 or 617, F.S. | further certify that when filing
this reinstatement application, the reason for dissolution has been eliminated, the corparate name satisfies the requirements ot section 607.0401 or 817.0401, F.§,, that all fees
owad by the corporation have been paid and the names of individuals listed on this form do not qualify for an examption under section 119.07(3)(), F.S. The information indicated
on this application is true and accurate, and my signature shalt have the same legal effect as if made under cath.

smnmuns% A/A Moshe Avegbock 3/26/04 QM -A2Y-8375

SIGNATURE AND TYPED QR PRINTEY NAME OF SIGNING QFFICER OR DIRECTOR Date Daytime Phona #

CR2E081 (0/04)
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CG Acournting Conporeation N

4107 Rastnsiwvod Road, Swte 111, Fort Landerdab, F1.33312 (954) 3274617 Fac (954) 3274618

March 20, 2004

Division of Corporations
PO Box 6327
Tallahassee, FL 32314

Re: Pleasant Investments Inc.

#P02000029827

AR - 2003, 2004
Dear State of Florida Representative,
We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. This corporation
never received their 2003 AR in the mail and wete thus dissolved. We

sent an e-mail (copy enclosed) to advise us how to proceed.

We are submitting the application together with the $300 fee, for 2003
and 2004. We appreciate the abatement of the late fee.

If any additional information is needed, please contact us.
Very truly yours,

David Goldis
DTG/cb



David Goldis

Page 1 of 1

From: "corphelp" <corphelp@does.state.fl.us>

To: "“David Goldis™ <david@cg-accounting.com>
Sent: Friday, March 26, 2004 2:29 AM

Subject: RE: Pleasant Investments - P02000028827

If the corporation has been administratively dissolved by this office for failure to file a uniform business report and
didn’t receive that notice from our office in the mail, you may submit a written request for waiver of the $600.00
reinstatement fee. You would send that letter with a completed reinstatement application and the regular filing fees.

The filing fee for each year dissolved is $150.00 and that must include the current year fees.

The reinstatement application can be downloaded at our web site www,sunbiz.org (click "Download Filing Forms").

Thanks,

Lee
Internet Access
Division of Corporations

-----0Original Message-----

From: David Goldis [mailto:david@cg-accounting.com]
Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2004 4:36 PM

To: corphelp

Subject: Pleasant Investments - P02000029827

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. My client is a foreigner who never received the original
AR (UBR) for 2003, and never realized that it wasn't received. We would like to immediately send in an AR to
reinstate the company, together with the fee of $300, covering the 2 years (2003-2004). We would appreciate an

abatement of the penalty. Thank you.

David Goldis

CG Accounting Corp.
(954) 327-4617

(954) 327-4618 fax
david@cg-accounting.com

This email is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is
addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or
otherwise exempt from disclosure under applicable law. 1f the reader of

this email is not the intended recipient or the employee or agent

responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this ’
communication in error, please immediately notify us by telephone and return
the original message to us at the listed email address, Thank You.

3/26/2004



