I FILED
2007 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION Jul 27,2007 8:00 am

DOCUMENT # P01000087013 07-27-2007 90008 010 ***150.00

1. Entity Name

ANNUAL REPORT
3 Secretary of State
LOS BUSINESS VENTURES, INC. S

Pringipal Place of Business Maliling Address -

.
£545 SW 72ND COURT 6545 SW 72ND COURT 40127 435

e R

07192007 No Chg-P CR2E034 (11/05)

DO NOT WR'TE IN THIS SPACE - 4., FE| Number Applied For
43-1952216 Not Applicable

$8.75 Additional
Fee Required

5. Cediticate of Status Desired a

6. Name and Acdress of Current Reglistered Agent

s O TOND QOURT DO NOT WRITE
VIAML FL 3919 IN THIS SPACE

B. The above named enlity submits this stalement for the purpese of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida. | am familiar with, and accept
the obligations of registered agenl.

SIGNATURE
i Signature, typed or prinled name of regrsigred agent and tile i applicable (NQTE. Registered Agenl signaure requied when reinstalng) DATE
FILE NOW!!! FEE IS $550.00 8. Election Campaign Financing $5.00 mMay Be
Due by September 14, 2007 Trust Fund Contribution. Added to Fees
19). OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS 1
TITLE PS
NAME GARCIA, CARLOS F

STREET ADDRESS | 6545 SW 72ND COURT
LITY-S7-2p MIAMI, FL 33143

TIILE

NAME

STREET ADDRESS
Ciy-51-2P

TLE
NAME

ey DO NOT WRITE

o | IN THIS SPACE

NAME
STREET ADORESS
CITY-S1-2P

TITLE

NAME

STREET ADDRESS
CITY-$1-2IP

TITLE
NAME
STREET ADDRESS

CITY-SI- 2P A

12. | heraby certify that the informatigh suppied with this filifg dobs not qualify for the exemptions contained in Chapter 119, Florida Statutes. | further certity that the information
i acdurate and 1hat my signature shall pave the same legal effect as if made under oath: that | am an officer or director
of the corporation or the recaiper ort o exdcute ihis report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appeaars in Block 10 or Block 11 if

-7 r/ ) 3547~ 200 |

SIGNATURE:

SIGNATY) D OR PRINTED WAMBIOF SIGNING OFFICER OR DIRECTOR




July 23, 2007
To Whom It May Concern:

We recently received a notice of intent to dissolve the corporation LOS Business
Ventures, Inc. We were a bit surprised as we sent out the renewal paperwork and check
on or about April 13, 2007. Upon receiving your notice, | reviewed our bank records and
noted that the check had not been cashed. Therefore we contacted the state and received
the information shown on the attached email and have resubmitted the paperwork with a
new check.

Please contact me at 305-442-2200 ext. 243 with any questions.

O

Carlo F. Garci




ya
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- ATTACHMENT

Yaneisy Toyos 4() /5\) 7/7['55
From: corphelp [corphelp@dos.state fl.us] # }00 [ () 0008?05

Sent: Thursday, July 19, 2007 10:54 AM
To: Yaneisy Toyos

Subject: RE: Notice of Intent to Dissolve

The Annual Report may be downloaded or you may file electronically. At our web site
(www.sunbiz.org), click on "File the 2007 Annual Report or Amended Annual Report,” to file
electronically. If you wish to download the form and pay by check, please select "Download the
2007 Annual Report Form".

If you did not receive_notice, there is a place on the form to indicate that and the $400.00 late fee
WiTBe waived. A late fee does not apply to the LLC. T

Thank You
Cathy
Interner Access

From: Yaneisy Toyos [mailto:Yaneisy. Toyos@gsplh.com]
Sent: Thursday, July 19, 2007 9:13 AM

To: corpheip

Subject: RE: Notice of Intent to Dissolve

Thank you for getting back to me. Actually the checks have not cleared. This is why he’s concerned.

Yaneisy Toyos
yaneisy.toyes@gsplh.com

- Goldstein Schechter Price Lucas Horwitz & Co., P.A.
2121 Ponce De Leon Blvd.
11th Floor
Coral Gables, FL 33134
Ph: (305} 442-2200, Fax: {305) 444-0880
www.gspih.comt

From: corphelp [mailto:corphelp@dos.state.fl.us]
Sent: Thursday, July 19, 2007 9:01 AM

To: Yaneisy Toyos

Subject: RE: Notice of Intent to Dissolve

No 2007 annual report has been filed or rejected for either of these entities. If a check was mailed in the last few
weeks, it could stili be in process, but if your check was mailed earlier than that, please check to see if it has
cleared your bank.

Thank you.

tee Rivers
Internet Access

210/27007



