2006 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION FILED

ANNUAL REPORT . Jul 25, 2006 8:00 am

DOCUMENT #P01000044720 Secretary of State

CANNON CO. ' 07-25-2006 90026 006 ***150.00

Principal Place of Business Mailing Address
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FT. LAUDERDALE, H. 33315 FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33315 50023045
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ATTACHMENT B -
Lisa Eley - , D/%J?()%&
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From: ~corphelp” <corphe!p@dos.st:¥te.ﬁ.us> ’bém O O Oq(/ 720

To: "Lisa Eiey” <lisaeley@earthlink.net>
Sent: Tuesday, July 18, 2006 11:59 AM
Subject: RE: filing by may 1st

| apologize, the annul report was filed for 2005 on May 2nd. The 2006 annual report has not been filed for
Cannon Co. at this time with the Division of Corporations. The annual report can be download or filed
electronically on our website at www.sunbiz.org. The late fees can be waived on the annual report if no prior
notice was received by mail before May 1st.

Rob
Internet Access

From: Lisa Eley {mailto:lisaeley@earthlink.net]
Sent: Monday, Juty 17, 2006 12:32 PM

To: corphelp

Subject: Re: filing by may 1st

Rob,

t asked if _cannondo filed and paid the $150.00 corp. fees. and you said in the email that they did. | received a
memo card saying we did not. can you please check for me. If we have not | will take care of it today.

thank you in advance

Lisa Eley
Cannon co.

863-946-1171
lisaeley@earthlink.net

— Original Message —
From: comphelp

To: Lisa Eley Cannon Collection
Sent: Monday, May 08, 2006 8:28 AM
Subject: RE: fiing by may 1st

The 2006 annual report has been received and filed with the Division of Corperations for Cannon Co. on May
2nd.

Rob
intemet Aooess

-—Original Message-—
From: Lisa Eley Cannon Collection [mailto:lisaeley@earthlink.net]
Sent; Monday, May 01, 2006 10:40 PM

7/18/2006
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- ATTACHMENT

Subject: filin may 1st ‘ @ / /C e >, f
bj g by may 1st_ " //%7/-(/—/6060 »
| tried to file and pay my corporation fees of $150.00 but | could not get any assistance. | have them to

send out but out of town. :

Please help. | do not want to get penalized.

Lisa Eley

Cannon Co.

745c.r. 721 loopd
moore haven, florida
33471

7/18/2006



