PLEASE READ ALL INSTRUCTIONS BEFORE COMPLETING THIS %%EDI

CORPORATION
REINSTATEMENT

FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE
Secretary of State
DIVISION OF CORPORATIQNS

DOCUMENT # P01000002548

1. Comoration Name

LEGAL MEDICAL SUPPORT CORP.
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2. Prir‘\cipal Difice Address 3. Mailing Office Address %é@ég?ﬁ% a } + ii 4 EES i} E, a -5 OU’
51574 44 AVENUE 515 N 44 AVENUE
Suite, Apt. #, etc. Sulte, Apt, ¥, elc,
4, Date Incorporated or Qualified
To Do Business In Florida 1/2/01
YCiyAState — T T T T - T | City & State - e s -
» FEI Number Applied For
HOLLYWOOD, FL HOLLYWOOD, FL 65-1075004 ot Fomreatic
Zj Col Zi Ci
iy iy " ountty 58.75 Additional Fee requircd
33021 USA 33021 USA " GERTIFIGATE OF STATUS DESIRED [ for & Certificate of Stas
7. Name and Address of Gurrent Registered Agent
Name DDD'j.BlUE;?EED
BUGIN, EDGARDO 03724 N4~-A1033--012  sw300) 00
Straat Address (P.O. Box Number is Not Accaptable)
515 N 44 AVENUE
Suite, Apt. #, £tc.
Ci% State Zip Code
HOLLYWOOD FL | 33021
8. |, being appointed the registered agent of the nameag corporation, {amiliar with and accept the obligations of section 607.0505 or 617.0503, F.S, :3=
- :
Signat ! - 2
ngnit::ié’ Agent \f i Date 3118/04 g
REGISTERED AGENT MUST SIGN <
9. Names and Street Addresses of Each Officer and/or Director (Florida nonpraofit corporations must list at least 3 diractors)
Titles Officers :m’;f’ :Jireciors (SJL:f?:etrA:r?é?grs 335313? City / State / Zip
PSTD | EDGARDO BUGIN 515 N 44 AVENUE HOLLYWOOQD, FL 33021
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10. | certify that | am an officer or director or the receiver or trustes empowered to execute this application as provided for in chapter 807 or 617, F.5. | turther cerlify that when filing
this reinstaterent application, the reason for dissolution has been eliminated, the comporate name satisfies the requirements of section 607.0401 or 617.0401, F.S,, that all fees
owed by the corporation have bean paid and the names of individuals listed on this form do not qualify for an exemption under section 119.07(3)(i), F.S. The information indicated

on this application is true and acturate, and my signature shall have the same legal effect as it made under oath.
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SIGNATURE:WEA%AQ Busia
GNATURE AND TYPED DR PRIﬁTED MAME OF SIGNING OFFICER OR DIRECTOR

208 -562- 3030

Daytime Phona #

7

3/18/04

Date




-y

CG Avonting Conporataon

4101 Rarennsvod Road, Suie 111, Fort Lawderdak, FI_ 33312 (954) 3274617 Fec (954) 3274618

March 18, 2004

Division of Corporations
PO Box 6327
Tallahassee, FL 32314

Re: Legal Medical Support Corp.
#P01000002548
AR - 2003, 2004

Dear-State of Flotida Representative,

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. This corporation
never received their 2003 AR in the mail and wete thus dissolved. We
sent an e-mail (copy enclosed) to advise us how to proceed.

We are submitting the application together with the $300 fee, for 2003
and 2004. We appreciate the abatement of the late fee.

If any additional information is needed, please contact us.

Very truly yours,

Dpod Adds

David Goldis
DTG/cb



----- Original Message -----
From: "Dunlap, Andy" <ADunlap@dos.state.fl.us <mailto:ADunlap@dos.state.fl.us>>

To: <david{@cg-accounting.com <mailto:david@ecg-accounting.com>>
Sent: Thursday, March 18, 2004 11:28 AM

Subject: Legal Medical Support - P01000002548

The only provision the Division of Corporations has for waiver of the
reinstatement fee is due to non-receipt of the original/second notice

annual report/ (UBR). A SIgned letter from the corporation stating . ___
non-receipt will need to accompany the completed Reinstatement Application
and check for $300.00.

Andy Dunlap
Division of Corporations

----- Original Message-----

From: David Goldis [mailto:david@cg-accounting.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 17, 2004 4:39 PM

To: corphelp

Subject: Legal Medical Support - P01000002548

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. My client is a foreigner who never received the original AR (UBR) for 2003,
and never realized that it wasn't received. We would like to immediately send in an AR to reinstate the company, together with the
fee of $300, covering the 2 years (2003-2004). We would appreciate an abatement of the penalty. Thank you.

David Goldis

CG Accounting Gorp.

(954) 3274617

(954) 327-4618 fax

david@cq-accounting.com <mailto;david@cq-accounting.com>
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