,

_PLEASE READ.ALLJNSTRUCTIONS BEFORE COMPLETING TH|S:FORM.

410. | certify that | am an officer or director or the receiver o trustee empowered to execute this application as provided for in chapter BO7 or 617, F.S. | further certify that when filing
this reinstatemant application, the rgasoen for dissalution has been eliminated, the corporate name satisfies the raquirements of section 607.0401 or 617.0401, F.S., that all fees

' 954-410-0789

BDaylime Phona #

10/17/03

Date

SIGNATURE: X

SlGNAﬁ_E AND TYPED OR PRINTED NAME OF SIGNING OFFICER OR DIRECTOR

ﬁrd/?c;

CORPORATION FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE 030CT 24 AH 9: 12
REINSTATEMENT Secretary of State
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS 0 . ‘..‘.; E)TATE
' T:{" FLLORIDA
DOCUMENT # P00000115503
1. Corporation Name
ONE STOP ENTERPRISES OF SOUTH FLORIDA INC
AR M PEONI fé‘ TR
2. Principal Office Address 3_. Mailing Offica Address [{%é; E‘ j‘ 4 Ui ‘J A j .___,U.}-..’.:d -l O’-S
7540 POLK STREET 7540 POLK STREET 8 Bttt T e,
Suite, Apt, #, etc, Suite, Apt, #, etc, )
e e e e - . -—— .- 1.4, T ualified (., 0y
 Tobo Buemess n Fonda - 111101
City & State City & State
5. FEI Number Applied For
HOLLYWOOD, FL HOLLYWOOD, FL Ba-1053080 L
Zip Country Zip Country 6.
33024 UsSA 33024 USA GERTIFICATE OF STATUS DESIRED [] s
7+ Name and Address of Currant Registered Agent
" OROZCO, IVAN
Strest Add P.C. Box Number is Not Acceptabl P TR
treet Address ox Number is Not Acceptable) 7540 POLK STREET 191:—15%:1[_1__; :la';tf:‘q__wﬁ ;*ﬁ:l 10
Suite, Apt. #, Etc.
“” HOLLYWOOD FL | 33024
. 8. |, being appointed the redisterad agpnt of the ab(c:tzjm_ed_gmmusn,am familiar with and accept the obligations of section 807.0505 or 617.0503, F.S. g:
. i . ' :
glag;iz::g; :\gem ¥ : Date 10/17/03 g
. - REGISTERED AGENT MUST SIGN o
9, Names and Streel Addresses of Each Officer and/or Director (Florida nonprofit corporations must list at least 3 directors)
Titles Officers ':ﬁc':'}if’ IfJirectors %tfrrfgr‘k::dr?gf Bfrggg: City / State / Zip
PSTD™ |OROZCO, IVAN = | 7540 POLK STREET- HOLLYWOQOGD, FL 32024 -
vD OROZCO, AMANDA 7540 POLK STREET HOLLYWOOD, FL 33024



CG Aconnting Conporation

' 4101 Reenssood Roud, Suie 111, Fort L avkrodae, FL. 33312 (954) 3274617 Faoc (954) 3274618
October 17, 2003

Uniform Business Report
Division of Corporations

PO Box 1500 ‘
Tallahassee, F1. 32302-1500 .

Re: One Stop Enterprises of South Florida Inc.
# P00000115503
"~ - 200UBR — -~ - -7 -

Dear State of Flonida Representative,
We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. This corporation never
received their 2003 UBR in the mail. We sent an e-mail and received a response

(copy enclosed) to advise us how to proceed.

We are submitting the application together with the $150 fee. We appreciate the
abatement of the late fee.

If any additional informaton 'is needed, please contact us.

Very truly yours,
Lo Add.

David Goldis
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David Goldis i e

From: "corphelp” <corphelp@dos.state.fl.us>

To: “David Goldis™ <cg-accounting@mindspring.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 16, 2003 11:10 AM

Subject: RE: One Stop Enterprises of South Florida - PO0000115503

'f the corporation has been administratively dissolved by this office for failure to file a uniform business report
ind didn't receive that notice from our office in the mail, you may submit a. written request (by mail) for waiver
of the $600.00 reinstatement fee. You would send that letter with a completed reinstatement application and the
-egular filing fees. The filing fee for each year dissolved is $150.00 and that must include the current year fees.
fou may download a reinstatement form from www.sunbiz.org.

Lesiie Sellers

.nternet Access

----- Original Message----- .

From: _David Goldis [mailto:cg-accounting@mindspring.com] I A _
Sent: Thursday, October 16, 2003 10:35 AM

To: corphelp

Subject: One Stop Enterprises of South Florida - P00000115503

We are the accountants for the above named taxpayer. My client never received the original UBR for 2003, and never realized
that it wasn't received. We would like to immediately send ih a new UBR together with the fee of $150. We would appreciate an
abatement of the penalty.

Thank you.

David Goldis

CG Accounting Corp.

(954) 327-4617 _

(954) 327-4618 fax . '
david@cg-accounting.com

This email is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is
addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential or
otherwise exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of

this emai! is not the intended recipient or the employee or agent _
responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please immediately notify us by telephone and return
the original message to us at the listed email address. Thank You.

S - ——

10/1TE£/50N07



