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COVER LETTER

TO: Amendment Section _
Division of Corporations

SUBJECT:_ Feric Faml ld Faundahon. Ine

Name of Corporanon

DOCUMENT NUMBER: Wi@ 00 00 000 g4

The enclosed Articles of Correction and fee are submitted for filing.

Please return all correspondence concerning this matter to the following:

TJenniter Caldwell

Name of Contact Person

tertie. Fomi I Foundafion

Firm/Company

2o Ridae Ave.

~J " Address

Cleorwotrer FL 33755

City/State and Zip Code

mr s (ehnifercal dwe @ Jahoo,com

\J E-mail address: (to be used for future annual report notification)

For further information concerning this matter, please call:

'J@Qt’.\.!.‘&if’ Caldwali at( 727 Y A3H-577

Name of Contact Person Area Code & Daytime Telephone Number

Enclosed is a check for the following amount:

)Z! $35.00 Filing Fee 0 $43.75 Filing Fee & Certificate of Status

(3 $43.75 Filing Fee & Certified Copy 0 $52.50 Filin% Fee, Certificate of Status &
Certitied Copy

Mailing Address: Street Address:

Amendment Section ' Amendment Section

Division of Corporations Division of Corporations

P.O. Box 6327 Clifton Building

Tallahassee, FL 32314 2661 Executive Center Circle

Tallahassee, FL 32301



FILED
ARTICLES OF CORRECTION 16 JEN -8

4:53
o TSEIF CTARY ar 2 IATE
I Mhn Iy W.-_f F LU!:]DLA

Name of Corpotation as currently filed with the Florida Dept. of State

Documenit Number (T known)

Pursuant to the grovisions of Section 607.0124 or 617.0124, Florida Statutes, this corporation files
these Articles of Correction within 30 days of the file date of the document being corrected.

These articles of correction correct Arh‘clﬁs of Jheer po raflg V)
(Document Typk Being Corrected)

filed with the Department of State on ___~Jownwand, 04, 20l
(File Date g} Document)

Specify the inaccuracy, incorrect statement, or defect:

EHeehve dote 1S Jonvory 04, 2401

Correct the inaccuracy, incorrect statement, or defect:
Effechive dak  gHould BE originad 4 'ma
dar  oF  pecember 2% 5015
“tecept and addihonod comespondence
attoohe o

a director, president or other offfcer - if directors or oﬁcers have
norbeen se]ecled by an incorporator - lf in the hands of the receiver, trustee, or
other court appomted fiduciary, by that fiduciary.)

“ennider Col dwel] Secre oy

(Typed or printed name of person signing} (Title of person igning}

Filing Fee: $35.00



Subject: Sunbiz.org Payment Receipt

From: donotreply@sunbiz.org (donotreply@sunbiz.org)

To: mrsjennifercaldwell@yahoo.com;

Date: Monday, December 28, 2015 2:19 PM

Thank you for submitting your payment to Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations.
This email will serve as confirmation that your payment was received by our office.
Your filing will be posted on our website http://www.sunbiz.org/ within 1-3 business days.

The transaction information is listed below:

Receipt Number: 3660155769

Transaction Date/Time: 12/28/2015 1:19:20 PM
Card Number: XXXX XXXX XXXX 4277
Card Type: Visa

Approval Code: 977336

Payment Amount: $70.00
Document Number: NEW



Subject: RE: RE: Fertic Family Foundation

From: corphelp {corphelp@DOS .MyFlorida.com)

To: mrsjennifercaldwell@yahoo.com;

Date: Thursday, December 31, 2015 12:01 PM

Thank you for your email. We have verified that your submission from 12/28 is in line, and the filing
section is currently working on corporations that were submitted on that day.

Thank you.

Lee Rivers, Internet Support Section

Florida Division of Corporations

From: Jennifer Caldwell [mailto:mrsjennifercaldwell@yahoo.com]
Sent: Wednesday, December 30, 2015 2:04 PM

To: corphelp

Subject: Re: RE: Fertic Family Foundation

Receipt 3660155769

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

From:"corphelp" <corphelp@DQOS.MyFlorida.com>
Date:Wed, Dec 30,2015 at 1:16 PM
Subject:RE: Fertic Family Foundation

Good afternoon,

Please reply back with either a tracking or receipt number.



Aghes Lumt
Internet Access
Division of Corporations

Florida Department of State

From: Jennifer Caldwell {mailto:mrsjennifercaldwell@yahoo.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 29, 2015 3:36 PM

To: corphelp
Subject: Fertic Family Foundation

Hello,
We are waiting for our business to appear on your site in order to open a bank account.

We are a private foundation and have a check from a donor that he would like to deposit prior to the end
of the year.

Can you please let me know when we'll see the Fertic Family Foundation go live on sunbiz.org?
thank you!
Jennifer Caldwell

727+234+5771

The Department of State is committed to excellence.
Please take our Customer Satisfaction Survey.




