2004 NOT-FOR-PROFIT CORPORATION
ANNUAL REPORT .

FILED
Jul 27, 2004 8:00 am

DOCUMENT # N01000008765

1. Entity Name
THE MACHACEK - KENLIN FOUNDATION, INC.

Secretary of State

07-27-2004 90035 009 ****6] 25

Principat Place of Business

2006-BEVERTY POINT RORD

Mailing Addrass

LEESBORG, FL 88— 27 £ ESBZZ—SHZ 3,:'
577 // /Z—Eou Q’( g FL

24064942

DO NOT WRITE IN THIS SPACE

R R

03192004 No Chg-NP

CR2E037 {10/03)

4. FEI Number Applied For
59-3761154 Not Applicable
5. Certificate of Status Desired [ $8.75 Acditional

- Fee Required

5. Name and Address of Current Registered Agent

[ _— - -

MACHACEK KENNETHW -

DO NOT WRITE
IN THIS SPACE

2 [2/ 07

" ihe obligations of . -
SIGNATURE /

(NOTE Registerect Agent signature required when reinstating)

/ot

8. Election Campaign Financing
Trust Fund Contribution.

Filing Fee Is $61.25
" Due by May 1, 2004

$5.00 may Be
Added to Fees

10 \ OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS

TITLE DP

NAME MACHACEK, KENNETH W
STREET ADDRESS | 2000 BEVERLY POINT ROAD
c-8T-2°0 | LEESBURG, FL 34748

TITLE Dy

NAME MACHACEK, LINDA L

STREET ABDRESS | 2000 BEVERLY POINT ROAD
Cy-sT-ZP | LEESBURG, FL 34748

TITLE DsT .

NAME YQUNG, HERBERT P JR

STREET ADDRESS | 206 NQRTH 3RD STREET -
CIY-ST-2iP LEESBURG, FL 34748

TITLE

HAME

STREET ADDRESS
CITY-57-2IP

TILE

NAME

SIREET ADDRESS
CiTY-ST-2P

TITLE

NAME

STREET ADDRESS
CITY-57-ZiP

"DONOT WRITE - © —| ~~~

IN THIS SPACE

12. | hereby certify that the information supgk€d with this filing d
indicated on this report or suppleme reportis true
of the corporation or the receiver gefrustes emp:
changed, or on an attachment

SIGNATURE: v

~withall other like empowerad.

not qualify for the exemption stated in Sectien 1192.07(3)(i), Florida Statutes. | further certify that the informaticn
ccurate and that my signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oatfy, that | am an officer or director
to execute this report as required by Chapter 617, Florida Statutes; and that

name ghpears in Block 10 or Block 11 if

/ SIGNATURE AND Ty{D ‘OR PRINTED NAME OF SIGNING OFFICER OR DIRECTOR

2L/

Daytirne Phone #

'
1
i



FOUNDATION CHECK WCI’VW

A

B 4

Ken Machacek %/uﬁf 00 00O % 7T 6 ’

Page 1 of 1

SHOUA Y.

From: Hanke.Linda [Linda.Hanke@SunTrust.com]
Sent:  Wednesday, July 14, 2004 11:28 AM

To: Ken Machacek

Subject: éE: FOUNDATION CHECK

I'll order the check today.
We ordered 2 previous checks to Florida Dept of State........

07/16/2003 = $61.25 paid on 07/29/2003
11/03/2003 ©  $61.25 paid on 11/19/2003

Let me know if you need anything else.

From: Ken Machacek [mailto:ken.machacek@leggett.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 13, 2004 5:26 PM

To: Hanke.Linda

Subject: FOUNDATION CHECK

Linda ....... Please request a check made payable FL Dept of State in the amount of $61.25 and have that
sent.to my home address. Please look back in our records for this year and late last year. We senta
check in the same amount to the same Payee some months ago. If you could identify that and advise the

date and if it cleared. Thanx — Ken

LE A S S A SRR LR R R EREE R AR RS EREEREEEEEREE

The information transmitted is intended solely
for the individual or entity to which it is
addressed and may contain confidential and/or
privileged material. Any review, retransmission,
dissemination or other use of or taking action
in reliance upon this information by persons or
entities other than the intended recipient is
prohibited. If you have received this email in
error please contact the sender and delete the

material from any computer.
***********************i’**********************A**

7/14/2004



N,

Mmoo 50—
Machacek — Kenlin Foundation, Inc. — -
5708 Crestviév? Drive WOO o0 0 8 7é S

Lady Lake, FL. 32159

Ref.: Overpayment of Filing Fee
i FEI# 59-3761154

Gentlemen,

. On or about September 20, 2003 we duplicate filed our 2003 Annual
Report The report was returned to us, however the check that was enclosed
for the Filing Fee was not. In fact SunTrust Bank reports that the check was
pald on-11/19/03. S " -

In that process we then failed to provide our 2004 report timely, as
reminded by the Notice of Intent to dissolve. The 2004 report is enclosed
with an additional Filing Fee.

. That said, it looks like we overpaid fees for 2003. We would ask that
you review and advise. Please note the address change. Thank You.

Presi ent
352 - 3455700

4 - - - PN . ~ - - - .
- - —-— el - - PRNOS - ——



