. « 2006 FOR PROFIT CORPORATION ¢ OL 183
ANNUAL REPORT

DOCUMENT # M73710

1. Entity Name

STEPHENSON ENTERPRISES ALUMINUM, INC.

(%]

~ILED
06JUL 20 AIg: 2

Principal Place of Business Mailing Address SoCRETARY OF STATE
6650-B TREELAND AVE., NORTH £650-B TREELAND AVE., NORTH vl LA foA SSEFE FL 0?3115 A
LARGO, FL 33773 S LARGO, FL 33773 US ’ A

AN RN I

07052006 No Chg-P CR2E034 (11/05)

DO NOT WRITE IN THIS SPACE. T N Aooea For

59-2878519 Mot Applicable

(] $8.75 Additional

5. Certificate of Status Desired Fee Required

8. Name and Address of Current Registered Agent
STEPHENSON, KENNETH
10326 57TH WAY NORTH Do NOT WRITE
PINELLAS PARK, FL 33782 IN TH IS S PAC E

8. The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agant, or both, in the State of Florida. | am familiar with, and accept
the obligations of registered agent,

SIGNATURE
Sipnature. typed or printad name of regestered agent and title # applcabla. (NOTE: Registarad Agent signature required whan seinstating) DATE
FILE NOW!I1 FEE IS $150.00 9. Election Campaign Financing $5.00 MayBe | In accordance with s. 607.193(2)b), F.S.. the
Due by September 6, 2008 Trust Fund Contribution. 00  AcdedtoFess corporation did not receive the prior natice.
10. QFFICERS AND DIRECTORS I
FITLE P
NAME STEPHENSON, KENNETH E Eﬂ!:!!_.-??gg 1 399
STREET ADDRESS | 10326 57TH WAY NORTH 07/21 N6——D1ONA-—112 %% 1;0. fin
omr-s-2p | PINELLAS PARK, FL 33782 T R
TITLE VP
NAME STEPHENSCN, JEREMY R

STREET ADDRESS | 6650-B TREELAND AVE., NORTH
COY-ST-2P LARGO, FL 33773

TITLE T
NAME STEPHENSON, TRAVIS E

nazr | RGO Bo17a DO NOT WRITE
IN THIS SPACE

NAME
STREET ADDRESS
CHY-ST-2IP

TITLE
NAME

STREET ADDRESS ) 7 2 O
CIY-ST-2IP
TITLE

NAME
STREET ADDRESS
CHTY-ST-DP

12, | hereby cenify that the information supplied with this iil:‘r:jg does nol quality for the exemptions contained in Chapler 119, Florida Statutes. | further certify that the information
indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my signature shall have the same legal effect as # made under oath; that | am an officer or director
of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered o execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes: and that my name appears in Block 10 or Block 11 i
changed, or on an attachment with an address, with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE/:%W 2 M’" <1 ¢

SIGNATURE AND TYPED OR PRINTED NAME OF SIGNING OFFICER OR DIRECTOR

Daytima Phone 8




DAVENPORT BUSINESS SERVICES, INC.
accounting and tax preparation

July 5, 2006
To Whom It May Concern:

This letter is to ascertain that Ken Stephenson in good faith had mailed the annual report renewal
back in January and just discovered that it had never processed. Please process this renewal
upon receipt.

Should you need any additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

gl Adcenprct

Douglas Davenport, Sr., E.A.

451 CENTRAL PARK DRIVE

LARGO, FL 33771

TeL 727.581.9690
 Fax 727.585.0754

www.ddavenport.com



Donna Kelley

poog 33

From: corphelp [corphelp@dos.state.fl.us]
Sent:  Monday, July 03, 2006 4:31 PM
To: Donna Kelley

Subject: RE: Annual Report

You can download the report and send it in with the regular filing fee. Please attach a letter stating that your
client had in good faith mailed the report back in January but has just discovered the filing never processed.

To access your 2006 Annual Report go to our web site www.sunbiz.org and in the center of the page above
“Our Site Index” you will see two banners, one is an option to file online using a credit card and the other lets

you download the report to be mailed in with payment.

Thanks,

Lee Yarbrough
Intermet Access

Division of Corporations

From: Donna Kelley [mailto:donna@ddavenport.com]
Sent: Monday, July 03, 2006 11:02 AM

To: corphelp

Subject: Annual Report

We have a client who issued the check for his corporate renewal back in January but it never processed. He
just discovered that the check never cleared the bank. It must have got lost in the mail. How can we renew the

corporation without paying the late fee?

Donna Kelley
Davenport Business Services, Inc.

(727) 581-9690 ext. 111

7/5/2006



