2022_FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY ANNUAL REPORT FILED

DOCUMENT# 121000022340 May 01, 2022
Entity Name: K&K CLEANING SERVICES LLC Secretary of State
6792265218CC

Current Principal Place of Business:

8000 COLONY CIRCLE SOUTH
105

TAMARAC, FL 33321

Current Mailing Address:

8000 COLONY CIRCLE 3QUTH
105
TAMARAC, FL 33321 US

FEI Number: NOT APPLICABLE Certificate of Status Desired; No
Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

HURST, ROMNALL L
80K0 COLONY CIRCLE $SQUITH

- — - o -3
105 et ?l_lquUHBL|C|C=4 I
TAMARAC, FL. 33321 US -
The above named enily submds this stalemenl for the purpose of changing 113 regesiered office or registered agent, or both i the Stare of Flonda
SIGNATURE: HURST. L RONALD 05/01/2022
Electronic Signalure of Reqislered Agent Date

Authorized Person(s) Detail :

Title MGR

Name HURST. RONALD L

Address 8000 COLONY CIRCLE SOUIH
UNIT 105

No a,u:H\orlﬂ to Lile

 horoby covuty thatl (P IOMMANGN (PGICHST O [N GO OF SUBKRIMONLM M1 15 VLG AT ACCLING 870G LRS! Ty QIOCUDNIG 1gNafnD skl Aave tho same iogal affoct as f made undor
Q3N IPa! | arn & MDY e M OF MAnaRes of It o hubsidy CONMPOMTY O ! FOCOVOT OF I'USICS QIMPGACrod 1G 0 roeuna el Tpart a3 roquantd oy Cruater 605, 1 lomiy Stafuies, and
(A My NAMe A0RARrs &bave. O o a0 aliachment with all ciher Ake erripwerm,

SIGNATURE: RONALD L HURST MGR 05/01/2022




o No a,u:Hnori‘l‘Y

Parishani, Andrea I.

From: Tisha Singletary <kandkcleaningforcommandres@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2023 12:30 PM

To: Parishani, Andrea |.

Subject: Re: Filling fees paid on somecne else business

" EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCE .

Hello,
I've never received a refund. s there something 1 need to do in order to receive this request?

On Thu, Feb 2, 2023 at 10:31 AM Parishani, Andrea |. <Andrea.Parishani@dos.myflorida.com> wrote;

Yes.

From: Tisha Singletary <kandkcleaningforcommandres@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 31, 2023 8:59 PM

To: Parishani, Andrea 1. <Andrea.Parishani@dos.myflorida.com>
Subject: Re: Filling fees paid on someone else business

. ' EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCE

Hello,

Ok thank you so very much for your time in this matter. Will the refund be sent to the card?

On Tue, Jan 31, 2023 at 2:43 PM Parishani, Andrea |. <Andrea.Parishani@dos.myflorida.com> wrote:

We cannot move the funds. We can only request a refund for the one filed in error.

From: Tisha Singletary <kandkcleaningforcommandres@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, January 27, 2023 12:05 PM
To: corphelp <corphelp@DOS.MyFlorida.com>

Sohiart: Cilling faoc n=aid mm cnmonmnes aleco Bores e oe e




, EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCE :

Hello,

Last year | paid and updated information on someone else's business in error. The document number that 1 paid filing
fees for was L21000022340. The company that the fees should've been paid for is L21000133504 (K&K Residential &
Commercial) the card used to pay the fees last four was 9595. It was completed on 05/01/2022. | was wandering if

the funds can be transferred to the correct account or if a refund can be given. Please advise. Thank you so very
much for your time in this matter.



