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2021_FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY REINSTATEMENT FILED

DOCUMENT# L19000122637 Oct 28, 2021
Entity Name: FAMILY COMPASSION ADULT DAY CARE LLC ' .12 ﬁ

Current Principal Place of Business:
11/23/21 BM

9237 PINEVILLE DR
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467

Current Mailing Address:

9237 PINEVILLE DR
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467 US

FEI Number: 85-2987757 Certificate of Status Desired: No
Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

I
DIEUJUSTE, ERIANA _ 11|

9237 PINEVILLE DR
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467 US
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The abova named entity submils this statement for the purpase of chenging s registered office or registerad agant, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE: ERIANA DIEUJUSTE 10/28/2021

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent Date

Authorized Person(s) Detail :

Title MGR
Name DIEUJUSTE, ERINA
Address 9237 PINEVILLE DR

City-State-Zip:  LAKE WORTH FL 33467
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| hetuby ceruly that ihe informabon indicaied on this repor or supplemental report 13 inse and accurate and that my slectronic signature shall have the same legal effect ax it made under
oatn; thal | am a managing member or manager of the imited kabilily company of The Iecener o¢ Irusles empowernd 1o axecule s report aa required by Chapler 605, Flonda Sislules: and

hal my name appears above, oF N AN allachment wih all olher like ampowsred,
SIGNATURE: ERINA DIEUJUSTE OWNER 10/28/2021

Electronic Signature of Signing Authorized Person(s) Detall Date




McKnight, Rebecca “Becky” pq_ 2 ot >

e
From: FICARReinstCorpHelp
Sent: Wednesday, November 17, 2021 11:32 AM
To: McKnight, Rebecca "Becky”
Subject: FW: Reinstatement accident/L19000122637

From: Erina Dieujuste <dieujusted2@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, November 6, 2021 10:28 AM

To: FICARReinstCorpHelp <FICARReinstCorpHelp@Dos.myflorida.com>
Subject: Re: Reinstatement accident/L19000122637

EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCL

Hello

I Mautes Desir had no authority or affiliation with the company | filed for reinstatement tor
Family Compassion Adult Day Care LLC

L.19000122637.

P.s if there is a way where the money can go towards her other business FAMILY COMPASSION HEALTH
LLC(L.2000024001 4) if she can't get the refund. that will be fine.

Thank You

On Thu. Nov 4, 2021 at 8:41 AM FICARReinstCorpHelp <FICARReinstCorpHelpdos. mvilorida.com>
wrole:

| will need vou to send an email stating vou have no authority and affiliation with that company vou filed the
reinstatement on

Division of Corporations

From: Erina Dieujuste <dieujusted2 @gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, October 29, 2021 6:51 PM

To: FICARReinstCorpHelp <FICARReinstCorpHelp@Dos.myflorida.com>
' Subject: Reinstatement accident/L19000122637

EMAIL RECEIVED FROM ENTERNAL SOURCE
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The attachments/links in this message have been scanned by Proofpoint.

119000122637

Family Compassion Adult Day Care LLLC

Erina Dieujuste 9237 Pineville Dr, Lake Worth, FL 33467

Hi. My nephew accidentally reinstated the wrong business that cost me $377.30. [ apologizce about the issue
and would like to ask for a refund.

Please let me know il there is anything 1 can do to help this situation.



