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Malave, Erin L1000 OO%CBQ

From: Melissa Moore [sttrini@yahoo.com]
Sent:  Tuesday, September 21, 2010 7:55 PM
To: Malave, Erin

Subject: Re: EIN NUMBER

Good Morning, Malave.

The name of the business is, IRAMES, L.L.C.

#3531676909, would of identify the application.

Thanking you in advance
Ms. Moore

I thought that receipt number

From: "Malave, Erin" <EMMalave@dos.state.fl.us>
To: Melissa Moore <sttrini@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tue, September 21, 2010 3:06:46 PM
Subject: RE: EIN NUMBER

Please reply nith the business name that you need updated.

Eirin M. Malave

Ameidnients

Bureait of Commercial Recording
Divivion of Corporations

Please take a few minutes to provide feedback on the quality of service you received from our staff. The Florida Department of State values
your feedback as a customer. Dawn K. Roberts, Florida Interim Secretary of State, is committed to continuously assessing and improving
the level and quality of services provided to you. Simply click on the link to the "DOS Customer Satisfaction Survey.” Thank you in advance

for your participation.

DOS Customer Satisfaction Survey

From: Melissa Moore [mailto:sttrini@yahoo.com]
Sent: Friday, September 17, 2010 5:17 PM

To: CorpAddressChange

Subject: Re: EIN NUMBER

To Whom It May Concern:

I, K. M. Moore hereby request that my EIN Number which is 59-3661457, is to be

placed on my L.L.C. License.
Thanking You In Advance.

KMMoore
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From: "donotreply@sunbiz.org" <donctreply@sunbiz.org>
To: sttrini@yahoo.com

Sent: Fri, September 17, 2010 4:48:19 PM

Subject: Sunbiz.org Payment Receipt

Thank you for submitting your payment to Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations.

This email will serve as confirmation that your payment was received by our office.
Your filing will be posted on our website http://www.sunbiz.org within 1-3 business days.

The transaction information is listed below:

Receipt Number: 3531676909

Transaction Date/Time: 9/17/2010 3:48:18 PM
Card Number: XXXX XXXX XXXX 7361
Card Type: MasterCard

Approval Code: 227413

Payment Amount: $125.00

Document Number: NEW

4178694B-E963-08B5-ACCC-7190DB9BA216
1.03.01
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