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COVER LETTER

TO: Registration Section
Division of Corporations

JNA CAPITOL.L.L.C.
SUBJECT:

(Name of Limited Liability Company)

The enclosed Articles of Dissolution and fee(s) are submitted for filing.

Please return all correspondence concerning this matter to the following:

DENISE D. CURRY

(Name of Person)

DENISE D. CURRY, EA, MA, INC.

(Firn/Company)

3516 KINLEY BROOKE LN

(Address)

CLERMONT, FL 34711

(City/State and Zip Code)

For further information concerning this matter, please call:

JILL ANDERSON 321 863.5077
at ( }

{Name of Person) {Area Code & Daytime Telephone Number)

Enclosed is a check for the following amount:

@ $25.00 Filing Fee and Centificate of Dissolution O3 $55.00 Filing Fee, Cestificate of Dissolution &
Certified Copy (additional copy is enclosed)

Mailing Address: Street Address:

Registration Section Registration Section

Division of Corporations Division of Corporations

P.O. Box 6327 The Centre of Tallahassee
Tallahassec, FI. 32314 2415 N. Monroe Street, Suite 810

Tallahassee, FL 32303



ARTICLES OF DISSOLUTION

FOR
A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY T

NS EELY

1. The name of a limited liability company is . =
INA CAPitTe, 1L AFEB 13 PH 2 gy
NI e T e,
2. The Articles of Organization were filed on A-1t- 2009 and asségnEHLLAHA'S‘S{;._.EQ 'f_{)tLI £

document number 207000015601
3. The delayed effective date the dissolution if not effective on the date of filing: “Ro-A%

(effective date cannot be prior to or more than 90 days later than date document s received for filing)
Note: If the date inscrted in this block does not meet the applicable statutory filing requirements, this date will not be
listed as the document’s effective date on the Department of State’s records.

4, A description of occurrence that resulted in the limited liability company’s dissoiution pursuant to section
605.0707, Florida Statutes, (copy 605.0707 on back cover letter).

Therz hags been ne business mnremne. Sor seveqal UL

and hn %-lu!& (core (5 6%Pc’c:€f&~

5. If there are no members, enter the name and address of the person appointed to wind up the company’s

activities and affairs:

6. Signature of an authorized person or if there are no members. the signature of the person appointed and listed
above to wind up the company’s activities and affairs:

K)Mu}u/ A /?{/l/{/\»{/f' DENISE D. CURRY

Signature ()’ Printed Name
FILING FEE: $25.00
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o @ Power of Attorney OM8 No. 1545-0150
For IRS Use On
(o, Janary 202 and Declaration of Representative or IRS Use Only
Oapartment of the Treasury Recelved oy:
Intemal Revenue Service » Go to www.l/ra,gov/Form2848 for Instructions and the Iatest Information. Narme
Power of Attorney Tolephons
Cautlon: A separate Form 2848 must be completed for each taxpayer. Form 2848 will not be honored Function
for any purpose other than representation before the IRS. Date

1

Taxpayer Information. Taxpayer must sign and date this form on page 2, line 7.

Taxpayer name and address

JNA CAPITOL, .C.
3516 KINLEY BROOKE LN
CLERMONT, FL 34711

L.I

Taxpayer identification number(s)
26-4286801

Daytime telephone number
(321)863-5077

Plan number (if applicable)

hereby appoints the foliowing representative(s} as attorney(s)-in-fact:
2 Represantative(s) musi sign and date this form on page 2, Part |,

Name and address

CAFNo. 0312-95760R

DENISE D. CURRY L
3516 KINLEY BRCOKE LN Telephone No.  (352)708-8094
CLZRMONT, FL 34711 Fax NO.
Check if to be sent coples of notices and communications  [] Check if new: Address (] Talephone No. [ ]  Fax No. [
Name and address CAFMNo. = o aeaT i
prv T TS
Telephone No.
Fax No' R L L T T T L T T s o T yravppp -
Chack if to ba sent coples of notices and communications  [] Check it new: Address []  TelephongNo. | J __ Fax Na. [
Name and address CAF No. 4 ‘T .'Z":- )
........................ FR T
PTIN 02
TelephoneNo. = mT
FaxNo. ot m.
(Note: IRS sends notices and communications to only two representatives,)) Check i new: Acdress [} Telephona No. [} Fax No. []
Name and addrass AR NG,
L
> 0 Pyphone NC e
(GO g™ e
{Note: IRS sends notices and communications 1o only two representatives.)] Check if new: Address [} Telaphone No. [ Fax No. [}

1o represent the taxpayer belors the Internal Revenue Service and perform

3
inspect my confidential tax information and to parform acts | can

tha following acts:

Acts authorized (you are reguired to completa Hine 3). Except for the acts described in lina 5b, | authorize my reprasentative(s) o raceive and

perform with respect to tha tax matters described below. For axample, my

representative(s) shall have the authority to sign any agreements, consents, or simitar docurents (see Instructions for line 5a for authorizing a

raprésentative to sign a return),

Description of Matter (income, Employment, Payroll, Excise, Estate, Gift,
Whistiablower, Practitioner Discipline, PLR. FOIA, Civil Penalty, Sec.
4980H Shared Responsibility Payment, etc.) (see instructions}

Tax Form Numbaer
(1040, 841, 720, atc) (it applicabla)

Year{s} or Period(s) (i applicable)
(see instructlons)

INCOME TAX AND RELATED MATTERS OF DISSOLUT

11205 2024

4  Speclfic use not recorded on the Centralized Authorization File {CAF). i the power of attorney Is lor a specific use not recorded on
CAF, chack this box. See Line 4. Specific Usa Not Recorded on CAF in the inatructions . . »
Sa  Additional acts authorized. In addition to the acts listed on lina 3 above, | authorize my representative(s) to perform the following ects (see

instructions for line Sa for more information): [ ] Access my IAS records via an Intermadiate Service Provider;

[ Authorize disclosure to third parties; {0 substitute or add reprasentative(s): iJ Sign a return;
(O Other acts authorized:
For Privacy Act and Paperwork Reduction Act Notice, see the instructions. gaa REV 02105726 TTBIZ Form 2848 (Rev. 1-2021)
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Form 2848 {Rev. 1-2025) Page 2

b Specific acts not authorized. My represantative(s) is (ara) not authorized to andorse or otherwisa negotiate any check (including directing or
accepting payment Dy any means, elactronic or otherwise, into an account owned or controlled by the representative(s} or any tirm or other
entity with whom the representative(s) is (are) agsociated) issued by the govemment in respect of a federal tax liability.

List eny other specific deletions to the acts otherwise authorized in this power of attorney (see instructions for line 5b).

8 Retentnon/revocahon of prior powsr{s) of attorney. The filing of this power of attorney automatically revokes all earier power(s) of

attorney on fila with the Internal Revenue Service for the same matters and years or periads covered by this form. If you do not want ta
revoke a prior power of attorney, check here . . . N

YOU MUST ATTACH A COPY OF ANY POWER OF ATTORNEY YOU WANT TO HEMAIN IN EFFECT

7 Texpayer declaration and signature. If a tax matter concerns a year in which a joint return was filed, each spouse must file a separate power

of attorney even if they are appointing the same representative(s). If signed by a corporate officer, partner, guardian, tax mattars partner,
partnership representative (or designated Individual, if applicable). executor, receivar, administrator, trustee, or individual other than the
taxpayer, | certily | have the legal authority to execute this form on behalf of the taxpayer.

» IF NOT COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND DATED, THE IRS WILL RETURN THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY TO THE TAXPAYER.

Print name Print nama of taxpayer from line 1 if other than individual

Declaration of Representative

Under penalties of perjury, by my signature below | declare that;

* | am not currently suspended or disbarred from practice, or ineligible for practice, before the Internal Revenue Service; =

* | am subject to regulations in Circular 230 (31 GFR, Subtitle A, Part 10}, as emended, governing practice bafure the Jn_{emal Revg\ua Service;

Famity Member—a member of the taxpayer's immediate family (spouse, parent, child, grandparent, grandchild, slap-pam..siep-c{.]@ prother, or sister).

* | am authorized to represent the taxpayer identified in Part | for the matter(s) specified there; and r"* - “‘:’{
*» | am one of the following: - ';3 .
a Attorney—a member in good standing of the bar of the highest court of the jurisdiction shown below, ];= N ol
b Certified Public Accountant—a holder of an aciive license to practice as a certified public accountant in the |urisdu:non &3ho»§'."J below-
c Enrolled Agent--enrolled as an agent by the IRS per the requirements of Circular 230 %c_ __.__ .
d Officer—a bona fide officer of the taxpayer organization. _ g w :.; N
& Full-Time Employee —a full-tima employee of the taxpayer. .-i e
f 'p
8

Enrolled Actuary— enrolled as an actuary by the Joint Board for the Enroliment of Actuaries under 28 U.8.C, 1242 (theg‘uthorhy to practice beforg
the |RS is limited by section 10.3{d) of Circular 230).

Unenrolled Return Praparer — Authority to practice before the IRS is limited, An unenrolled return preparer may represent, provided the preparer {1}
prepared and signed the return or claim tor refund (or prepared if there is no sighature space on the formy); (2) was afigible to sign the retum or
claim for refund; (3) has a valid PTIN: and (4) possesses tha required Annual Filing Season Program Record of Completion(s). See Special Rules
and Requirements tor Unenrolled Return Preparers in tha instructions for additionsl informatfon.

Qualifying Student or Law Graduate —recaives parmissien to represent taxpayers before the IRS by virtue of his/her status as g law, business, or
accounting student. or law graduate working in a LITC or STCP. Ses ingtructions for Pant Il for additional information and requirements.

Enroiled Retirement Plan Agent—enrolied as & retiremant plan agent under the requirements of Circular 230 (the authority 1o practice before the
internal Revenue Service is limited by saction 10.3(e)).

> [F THIS DECLARATION OF REPRESENTATIVE IS NOT COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND DATED, THE IRS WILL RETURN THE
POWER OF ATTORNEY. REPRESENTATIVES MUST S!GN IN THE ORDER LISTED IN PART |, LINE 2.

Note: For designations d-f. enter your title, position, or relationship to the taxpayer in the “Licensing jurlsdiction™ column.

Licensing jurisdiction

Designation— Stat th Bar, licensa, certification,
Insert above iic(enasiz)goa:uct‘hoi:ty registration, or enrolimant Signature Dats
letter {a—). of applicable) number (if applicable)
2 S L. L
c IRS 118710 /{,quk,dt A (o e Jd LK /k/

7}

REV 02005725 TTBIZ Form 2848 (Rev. 1-2021)



