2021 _FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY REINSTATEMENT
DOCUMENT# LO5000070113
Entity Name: EVEREST INVESTMENT GROUP LLC

Current Principal Place of Business:

1116 PARTRIDGE AVENUE
MIAMI SPRINGS, FL 33166

02/09/21 BM

Current Mailing Address:

1116 PARTRIDGE AVENUE
MIAMI SPRINGS, FL 33166 US

FE! Number: 74-3149311 Certificate of Status Desired: No
Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

PEREZ, ORLANDO
1116 PARTRIDGE AVENUE
MIAMI SPRINGS, FL 33166 US

The abovo named entity submuts this statpment for tha purpose of changing is rogisiered offica or registarad agent, or both, in the State of Flonida.

SIGNATURE: ORLANDO PEREZ 01/25/2021

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent Date

Authorized Person{s} Detail :

Title MGMR Title SECRETARY

Name PEREZ, ORLANDO Name PEREZ, JEANNETTE
Address 1116 PARTRIDGE AVENUE Address 1116 PARTRIDGE AVENUE
City-State-Zip:  MIAMI SPRINGS FL 33166 City-State-Zip: MIAMI SPRINGS FL 33166
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| harety carLly thal the wilormation mAicalad on this repor of supplemental report is irue and accurkie and that my siectronic sgnaiure shall have the same jegal efioct a3 \f made under
calh: (hat | am a manag:ng member or manager of (he himted kobtiity company or the recenor or irustes empowered fo sxecule IS repor as required by Chepter 605, Flonds Statutas; and
that my name sppears above, of 00 AN attachment with alf olher bka srmpowsmed.

SIGNATURE: ORLANDO PEREZ PRESIDENT 01/25/2021

Electronic Signature of Signing Authorized Person(s) Detail Date




McKnig ht, Rebecca "Becky”

From: Jeannette Regalado <jeannette_regalado@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, January 29, 2021 10:05 AM

To: Orlando Perez; McKnight, Rebecca "Becky"

Subject: Re: REIN BY MISTAKE

EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCLE

Good Morning Becky,

As per your request, | was writing to address the mistake which was done on the reinstatement of Orlando Perez’s
Corporation Everest Investment Group, LLC. | do help Orlando with his bookkeeping and have assisted with his
corporate affairs in the past and inadvertently assumed he missed the reinstatement of Everest not knowing he does not
operate the Corporation any longer.

Please excuse my mistake and do not punish Mr. Perez my withholding refund of his $660.

Jeannette

On Friday, January 29, 2021, 10:00:28 AM EST, Orlando Perez <operez3325@yahoo.com> wrote:

Jeannette,
Please respond the beiow request from Becky Mcknight.
Thank you.

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: McKnight, Rebecca "Becky <rebecca.meknight@dos.myflorida.com>

To: Criando Perez <operez3325@yahoo.com>; King, Deidre R. <deidre king@dos.myflorida.com>
Cc; Wilson, Theresa R. <theresa.wilson@does.myflorida.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 27, 2021, 09:15:48 AM EST

Subject: RE: REIN BY MISTAKE

Good moming,.

[n order to proceed the person who filed it (your account) will need to provide an email stating he had no
authority to file the reinstatement.



Becky McKnight
Senior Section Administrator
Bureau of Commercial Recording

Division of Corporations

Click here for current processing dates

From: Orlando Perez <operez3325@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 26, 2021 8:44 PM

To: King, Deidre R. <Deidre.King@DOS MyFlorida.com>

Cc: McKnight, Rebecca "Becky" <Rebecca.McKnight@DOS.MyFlorida.com>; Wilson, Theresa R.
<Theresa Wilson@dos. myflorida.com>

Subject: Re: REIN BY MISTAKE

EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCE = '

| understand your stance but my accountant has no authority or affiliation with the company. | do not use or need this
company to be reinstated and a $600 charge in this climate is crushing to my finances. | was furloughed for over 4
months and need these funds more than ever, it was a mistake and | called you the same day. Please make a exception
and refund me this fee.

On Jan 26, 2021, at 3:15 PM, King, Deidre R, <Deidre. Kina@dos.myflorida com> wrote:

Mr. Perez,

The only time the reinstatement and or Annual Report is refunded is if you have no authority and
affiliation with the company.

Unfortunately since it is public recorded it cannot be voided and or refund.



Regards,

Deidre King

Supervisor
Fict./AR/Notary Section
Division of Corpoerations
Dept. of State
(850)245-6932

Deidre.king@dos.myflorida.com

REFUND BY MISTAKE FILED ON ACCT
ACCOUNTANT FILED BY MISTAKE
PH: 305-336-7513

EMAIL: OPEREZ3325@YAHOO.COM

OLANDO PEREZ

REFUND REQUEST
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