79979

7 FRIMRIm

400119473514

(Address)

(City/State/Zip/Phone #) 03/07/08--01011--006  *#35,00

[ rckup [Jwar [ ma

(Business Entity Name)

{(Document Number)

. <2 ]
Certified Copies Certificates of Status : o % )
“‘J‘:’:"’:‘:A ‘;0 O
Tt
?f;’;-\'\ E,.."; — @
AU
Special Instructions to Filing Officer: e 5 M
B
S T O
%7 o
En;rﬂ L
7o
—f
Den e
—m &
—
o X
Tm Z T
.,
> = uemw
$ _'3 O Sm
Office Use Only nmw -~ -
e 2 m
o O
. zE N
m -
| oogioie MAR 1 0 2008 S
\/ NNT s |
[ ]
T e . ~ A e NN D



- “When you need ACCESS to the world”

ACCESS,

INC.

. 236 East 6th f\vcnuc . Tallahassce, Florida 32303
P.O. Box 37066 (32315.7066) '~  (850) 222-2666 or (800) 969-1666 . Fax (850) 222-1666

WAILK IN
PICK UP: 2|70 EW
] CERTIFIED COPY
‘g[ PHOTOCOPY
0 CUS
ﬁ FILING Awmen CW-‘-’

The Charmettes Tac.

1.

{CORPORATT, NAMl AND DOCUMEN'TT #)
2.

(CORPORATL NAME AND DOCUMENT #)
3.

{CORPORATL NAME AND DOCUMENT #)
4.

{CORPORATI. NAME AND DOCUMENT #)
5.

(CORPORATE. NAME AND DOCUMENT #)
6.

(CORPORATE NAME AND DOCUMENT #)

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:




Division of Corporations

March7,2008 CO\[ Nt

Tallahassee, FL 32303

FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE
C—\r.o

Corpé)rate Aﬁlczess, Inc.
236 East 6th Avenue .—\7 \ Q/WJ

SUBJECT: CHARMETTES, INC.
Ref. Number: 709679 | Q

We have received your document for CHARMETTES, INC. and your check(s)
totaling $35.00. However, the enclosed document has not been filed and is being

returned for the following correction(s):

the document must contain: (1) a statement that there are no members or
members entitied to vote on the amendment and (2) the date of adoption of the

amendment by the board of directors.

The document must be signed by the chairman, any vice chairman of the board
of directors, its president, or another of its officers.

If you have any questions concerning the filing of your document, please call
(850) 245-6907.

Annette Ramsey
Regulatory Specialist |l Letter Number: 908A00014283

O HY 01 4¥H 80

QAALS

Oh
b
i

53y

Y
el



Articles of Amendment
to
Articles of Incorporation
of

- CHARMETTES, INC.
(Document Of Corporation No.: 709679 -

Pursuant to the provisions of section 617.1001 and 617.1002, Florida Statutes, this Florida Not
for Profit Corporation adopts the following amendment(s) to its Articles of Incorporation:

Amendments Adopted: (Other than name change):

1. ARTICLE IX is hereby amended by deleting the words “ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY
THOUSAND DOLLARS ($50,000)”, and by inserting, in lieu thereof, the words “ONE
MILLION DOLLARS ($1,000,000).”

2. ARTICLE X is hereby amended by deleting the words “THREE HUNDRED
THOUSAND DOLLARS ($300,000)”, and by inserting, in lieu thereof, the words “TWO
MILLION DOLLARS ($2,000,000).”

The date of each amendment(s) adoptlon by the Board of Directors is: é@ﬂ' A 200 V4
effective immediately. :

Effective date if applicable: Date of Adoption

Adoption of Amendments:

The amendments were adopted by the Board of Directors without membership action, and
mernbershlp actlon was not requlred There are mo members and no members eligible to vote.

Signature: [N _
a digector, president-or other-officer) ~

/A

(Ty-fjéd’or printed name of pefson signing)

N/, /1
Tige of person si-gﬁing)

TENIE

VOIM014 " 33SSYHY 1YL
JIVIS 40 A¥VL3H03S
IZ:2IHd 01 ¥y 80




