e NOODOAZI | | &

From: Shoffstall, Lyn

Sent: Monday, March 06, 2017 3:11 PM
To: . ‘chaseisaacs@gmail.com'’
Subject: Mobile Millionaire LLC

Due to your failure to respond to our emails of January 6 and January 30, 2017, the above named limited liability
company has been cancelled for non-payment as of March 1, 2017.

The name of this entity is now available for use.

Please contact this office should you have any questions.

é,wr fhfﬁ'mﬂf Bureau Chief

Bureau of Commercial Recording
Division of Corporations

Florida Department of State
850-245-6500
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Shoffstall, Lyn

From: Shoffstall, Lyn

Sent: Menday, January 30, 2017 2:52 PM
To: ‘chaseisaacs@gmail.com’

Cc Yarbrough, Lee

Subject: Maobile Millianaire, LLC

Mr. Isaacs,

You were previously contacted concerning the payment for the organization of the above named limited liability
company.

Our records indicate no payment was received for this filing. The purpose of this letter is again to advise of this error
and ask that you remit payment in the amount of $130.00 by check, immediately.

If payment is not received by March 1, 2017, your limited liability company will be cancelled for non-payment and the
name will be immediately available.

Please remit the payment ta my attention.

Thanking you in advance for your attention to this matter.

/yﬁ féaff.f&‘a//f Bureau Chief

Bureau of Commercial Recording
Division of Cerporations

Florida Department of State
850-245-6900



Shoffstall, Lyn

From: Yarbrough, Lee

Sent: Monday, March 06, 2017 10:00 AM
To: Shoffstall, Lyn

Subject: FW: MOBILE MILLIONAIRE LLC

Lee Yarbrough

Senicr Section Administrator
Florida Department of State
Division of Corporations
New Filings Secticn

From: Yarbrough, Lee

Sent: Friday, January 6, 2017 2:17 PM .
To: 'chaseisaacs@gmail.com' <chaseisaacs@gmail.com>
Subject: MOBILE MILLIONAIRE LLC

Good Afternoon,

On 12/28/2016 Articles of Crganization were filed for MOBILE MILLIONAIRE LLC and assigned document
number L16000233155.

After an internal audit it has been brought to our attention that the credit card transaction using Visa ending
2229 was voided on 12/28/2016 10:33:44 AM.

In order for the LLC to remain active we will need to receive the filing fee in the amount of $130.00 ($125.00
Articles of Organization/ $5.00 Certificate of Status) in the form of a check or money order made payable to
the Florida Department of State. Please mail to my attention at the address below.

If it was your intention to cancel this filing, please reply back to confirm.
Mail to:

Lee Yarbrough *Personal & Confidential *

Division of Corporations

PO Box 6327

Tallahassee, FL 32314

Respectfully,

Lee Yarbrough

" Senior Section Administrator

Florida Department of State



Divisionvof Corporations
New Filings Section
850-245-6556

The Department of State is committed to excellence.
Please take our Customer Satisfaction Survey.




