2023 FLORIDA LIMITED_LIABILITY COMPANY ANNUAL REPORY

DOCUMENT# LO7000083964
Entity Name: AUTO REPAIR LLC

Current Principal Place of Business:

59817 FUNSTON ST
A2

HOLLYWGOD, FL 33023

Current Mailing Address:

11606 NV 29TH ST
A3
CORAL SPRINGS, FL 33065 US

FEl Number: 84-2132359

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

FRANCOIS, BILLY

11606 NW 29TH ST

A3

CORAL SPRINGS. FL 33065 US

FILED
Mar 14, 2023
Secretary of State
8675391549CC

SO0403 ] D5

N
I

Certificate of Status Desired: No

The above named enity Subvmils his slatarnent for the purpose of changing (1 registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Flonda

SIGNATURE: BILLY FRANCOIS

03/14/2023

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent

Authorized Person(s) Detail :

Tile MGR

Name FRANCOIS. BILLY

Address 11606 Nw 29TH ST
£3

Ciy-State-Zip:  CORAL SPRINGS FL 33085

Date

No a,w{'{ﬂorf{’y +o Lile
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SIGNATURE: BILLY FRANCQIS

MGR 03/14/2023

Electronic Signature of Signing Autnorized Person(s) Detail

Date



Parishani, Andrea .

From: Data WaveTax <data@wavetax.us>
Sent; Friday, April 27, 2023 11:21 AM
To: Parishani, Andrea I.

Subject: Re: Annual Report

o EMAIL RECEIVED FROM EXTERNAL SOURCE )

Hello my data is:

Account Number: ’

Account name: Wave Capital Solutions

Mailing address: 1936 Bruce B Down BLVD Suite 134
Phone: (813} 510-7769

Thanks

On Thu, Apr 20, 2023 at 3:51 PM Parishani, Andrea |. wrote:

Please include your name, address and phone number on your statement.

From: Data WaveTax <data@wavetax.us>
Sent: Monday, April 17, 2023 1:13 PM
To: Parishani, Andrea l. <

Subject: Annual Report

EMAIL RECEIVED-FROM EXTERNAL SOURCE -

Good morning

I did not have the authorization to renew the company auto repair LLC (renewal payment document LO7000083964 },
which was made as a mistake. The company | wanted to renew is auto repair 276 LLC L20000233885.

Best regards



